



| AWARDED VENDORS: |  | <b>D &amp; W Diesel, Inc.</b><br>1503 Clark Street Road<br>Auburn, NY 13021<br>Contact: Susan Clickner<br>315-253-2324 ext. 1108<br>s.clickner@dwdiesel.com |              |                                      |                            | <b>Fleet Pride</b><br>508 Temple Hill Road<br>New Windsor, NY 12553<br>Contact: Darryl Cartwright<br>845-561-6280<br>darryl.cartwright@fleetpride.com |              |                                      |                            | <b>IEH Auto Parts, LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts</b><br>901 North Lenola Road<br>Moorestown, NJ 08057<br>Contact: Brian Evanoka<br>855-214-9055<br>s498@autoplusap.com |                   |                                      |                            |
|------------------|--|---|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|---|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|---|-------------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| Item #           | Description  | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date      | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost |
| 5                | Brake parts, linings, drums, rotors, pads, calipers, hoses, valves and associated specialized hardware                                 | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | OTR lining - Fletp 9999 list  | 01/05/21     | 60.00%                               | n/a                        | Meritor   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | OTR valves, hose - Fletp 114 + Fletp 2761   | 01/05/21     | 60.00%                               | n/a                        | Webb  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Drums/Rotors - OTR 64, Web 65, Gunite 708   | 01/05/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        | Bendix CVS  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Centric - CENTC 242   | 01/04/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Velvac  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 6                | Cooling system parts and accessories including radiator, heater core, hoses and associated specialized hardware                        | D&W online catalog  |              | 0.00%                                |                            | OTR TSM - Fletp 7280  | 01/05/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Four Seasons  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  | found at dwdiesel.com   |              |                                      |                            | Gates - Gates 604   | 01/05/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | APDI  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Flex Tech - Flete 601   | 01/08/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Gates   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            |   |              |                                      |                            | Spectra   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 7                | Electrical parts and accessories (not lighting) including switches, relays, solenoids and associated specialized hardware              | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | Power Products - POWEP 12   | 01/05/21     | 60.00%                               | n/a                        | Standard  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Little Fuse - LTTLE 636   | 01/05/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        | Wilson  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Cobe Herse - COLHR 805  | 01/05/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        | Motormite   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 8                | Engines and engine parts and accessories including ERG coolers, turbos, compressor, fitting tubing and associated specialized hardware | D&W online catalog  |              | 0.00%                                |                            | Dorman - DRMPR 158  | 01/04/21     | 45.00%                               | n/a                        | Fel-Pro   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  | found at dwdiesel.com   |              |                                      |                            | OTR Turbo - fleet 7075  | 01/04/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        | FP Diesel   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            |   |              |                                      |                            | Sealed Power  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |



| AWARDED VENDORS: |  | <b>D &amp; W Diesel, Inc.</b><br>1503 Clark Street Road<br>Auburn, NY 13021<br>Contact: Susan Clickner<br>315-253-2324 ext. 1108<br>s.clickner@dwdiesel.com |              |                                      |                            | <b>Fleet Pride</b><br>508 Temple Hill Road<br>New Windsor, NY 12553<br>Contact: Darryl Cartwright<br>845-561-6280<br>darryl.cartwright@fleetpride.com |              |                                      |                            | <b>IEH Auto Parts, LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts</b><br>901 North Lenola Road<br>Moorestown, NJ 08057<br>Contact: Brian Evanoka<br>855-214-9055<br>s498@autoplusap.com |                   |                                      |                            |
|------------------|--|---|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|---|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|---|-------------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| Item #           | Description  | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date      | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost |
| 15               | Lamps/lighting, lenses, signals, brackets and associated specialized hardware (interior and exterior)          | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | Grote - GROTE 370   | 01/04/21     | 55.00%                               | n/a                        | Wagner  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Trucklite - TRCLT 380   | 01/04/21     | 55.00%                               | n/a                        | Grote   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | OTR - POWRP 365   | 01/05/21     | 60.00%                               | n/a                        | Truck Lite  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 16               | Lubricating systems parts and accessories including tanks, fittings, hoses and associated specialized hardware | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | Gates - Gates 605 Jobber  | 01/04/21     | 10.00%                               | n/a                        | Plews   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Power Products - POWRP list   | 01/05/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Lincoln   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 17               | Preventive maintenance items including specialized filters and fluids  | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | Baldwin Filter - BLDFL 845 Jobber   | 01/04/21     | 45.00%                               | n/a                        | AFS   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | OTR Oil & Grease - Fletp 7101   | 01/05/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | CRC   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | OTR Diesel Exhaust Fluid - Fletp 7102   | 01/05/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Permantex   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | CRC - CRCIN 842   | 01/04/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Radiator Specialty  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 18               | Radiators, heater cores, heat exchanger, hoses and associated specialized hardware                             | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | OTR TSM - Fletp 7280 list   | 01/05/21     | 60.00%                               | n/a                        | APDI Radiators  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Fleotech - Fletc 601 list   | 01/08/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | APDI Heater Cores   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | OTR HVAC - Fletc 4361 list  | 01/08/21     | 45.00%                               | n/a                        | Spectra   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Breeze Clamps - BREZCL list   | 01/05/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        |   |                   |                                      |                            |
| 19               | Reflectors, decals, safety items and associated specialized hardware   | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | Grote - Grote 370   | 01/04/21     | 55.00%                               | n/a                        | Truck Lite  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Truck Lite - TRCLT 380  | 01/04/21     | 55.00%                               | n/a                        | Grote   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |   |              |                                      |                            | OTR - POWRP 365   | 01/05/21     | 60.00%                               | n/a                        |   |                   |                                      |                            |

| AWARDED VENDORS: |   | D & W Diesel, Inc.<br>1503 Clark Street Road<br>Auburn, NY 13021<br>Contact: Susan Clickner<br>315-253-2324 ext. 1108<br>s.clickner@dwdiesel.com |              |                                      |                            | Fleet Pride<br>508 Temple Hill Road<br>New Windsor, NY 12553<br>Contact: Darryl Cartwright<br>845-561-6280<br>darryl.cartwright@fleetpride.com |              |                                      |                            | IEH Auto Parts, LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts<br>901 North Lenola Road<br>Moorestown, NJ 08057<br>Contact: Brian Evanoka<br>855-214-9055<br>s498@autoplusap.com |                   |                                      |                            |
|------------------|---|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|--|-------------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| Item #           | Description   | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date      | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost |
| 20               | Seating, upholstery and associated repair parts and specialized hardware  | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | No Bid   |                   |                                      |                            |
| 21               | Stanchions, grab rails and associated specialized hardware  | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | No Bid   |                   |                                      |                            |
| 22               | Steering components and parts including spindle, tie rod ends and tube, king pin, pitman arms and associated specialized hardware | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | OTR Tie Rods - Fletp 5339  | 01/04/21     | 45.00%                               | n/a                        | Edelmann   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | OTR King Pins - Fletp 7739   | 01/04/21     | 55.00%                               | n/a                        | Meritor  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Dayton - DYTTPR 185  | 01/04/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Euclid   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Stemco Kover - KAISR 275   | 01/04/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Moog   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 23               | Transmission parts and accessories including TCU, convertor, hoses and associated specialized hardware                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | OTR Transmissions - Fletp 4444   | 01/05/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        | No Bid   |                   |                                      |                            |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Eaton - Eaton 892  | 01/04/21     | 35.00%                               | n/a                        |  |                   |                                      |                            |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | OTR Valves Fletp - 114   | 01/05/21     | 35.00%                               | n/a                        |  |                   |                                      |                            |
| 24               | Undercarriage/frame including alignment parts and accessories and associated specialized hardware                                 | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | No Bid   |                   |                                      |                            |
| 25               | Wheel end parts including hubs, seals, rims, bearing, spindles and associated specialized hardware                                | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            | NTN Bearings - NTNXX 487   | 01/04/21     | 45.00%                               | n/a                        | BCA/National   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Seal - Stemco 140 SKE 510  | 01/04/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Moog   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | OTR Hubs - Fletp 60  | 01/05/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        |  |                   |                                      |                            |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Webb - WBBWH 65/Gunite - ACCR 708  | 01/04/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        |  |                   |                                      |                            |

| AWARDED VENDORS:  |  | <b>D &amp; W Diesel, Inc.</b><br>1503 Clark Street Road<br>Auburn, NY 13021<br>Contact: Susan Clickner<br>315-253-2324 ext. 1108<br>s.clickner@dwdiesel.com |              |                                      |                            | <b>Fleet Pride</b><br>508 Temple Hill Road<br>New Windsor, NY 12553<br>Contact: Darryl Cartwright<br>845-561-6280<br>darryl.cartwright@fleetpride.com |              |                                      |                            | <b>IEH Auto Parts, LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts</b><br>901 North Lenola Road<br>Moorestown, NJ 08057<br>Contact: Brian Evanoka<br>855-214-9055<br>s498@autoplusap.com |                   |                                      |                            |
|---|--|---|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|---|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|---|-------------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| Item #  | Description  | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name  | Catalog Date      | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost |
| 26  | Wheelchair lifts including parts, accessories and associated specialized hardware              | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | No Bid  |                   |                                      |                            |
| 27  | Windows and doors including parts, accessories and associated specialized hardware             | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | Dorman - DRMPR 3136   | 01/04/21     | 45.00%                               | n/a                        | Motormite   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 28  | Windshield wipers and washers including parts, accessories and associated specialized hardware | No Bid  |              |                                      |                            | Trico - Trico 68  | 01/04/21     | 40.00%                               | n/a                        | Anco  | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|   |  |   |              |                                      |                            | Autotecx - AUTEX 684  | 01/04/21     | 50.00%                               | n/a                        | Trico   | NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18 | 61.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| <b>See RFB-DCP-06-21 specifications for detailed terms and conditions</b> |  |   |              |                                      |                            |   |              |                                      |                            |   |                   |                                      |                            |

| <p align="center"><b>County of Dutchess</b><br/> <b>Bid # RFB-DCP-06-21</b><br/> <b>Replacement Parts for Dutchess County Public Transit Heavy-Duty Vehicles</b><br/> <b>Term: March 1, 2021 through December 31, 2022</b></p> |  |  |             |              |              |   |                            |              |              |
|--|--|--|-------------|--------------|--------------|---|----------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| <b>AWARDED VENDORS:</b>  |  | <p align="center"><b>Muncie Reclamation and Supply</b><br/> <b>dba Muncie Transit Supply</b><br/> <b>3720 South Madison Street</b><br/> <b>Muncie, IN 47302</b><br/> <b>Contact: Becky Huff</b><br/> <b>765-288-1971</b><br/> <b>bhuff@abc-companies.com</b></p> |             |              |              | <p align="center"><b>Parts Authority, LLC</b><br/> <b>3 Dakota Drive, Suite 110</b><br/> <b>New Hyde Park, NY 11042</b><br/> <b>Contact: Michael G. Brown</b><br/> <b>570-751-6562</b><br/> <b>fleetbids@partsauthority.com</b></p> |                            |              |              |
|  |  | Item #   | Description | Catalog Name | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price  | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name | Catalog Date |
| 1  | Aftertreatment parts and accessories including DEF, DOC, tank, sensor and associated specialized hardware              | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21    | 12.00%       |              | No Bid  |                            |              |              |
|  |  |  |             |              |              |   |                            |              |              |
| 2  | Air conditioning, heating, ventilation parts and accessories and associated specialized hardware                       | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21    | 12.00%       |              | Four Seasons  |                            | 66.00%       | 25.00%       |
|  |  |  |             |              |              | UAC Temp Control (Universal Air Conditioning)   |                            | 66.00%       | 25.00%       |
| 3  | Axels including suspension, springs, shocks, struts, air bags, spindles, king pins and associated specialized hardware | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21    | 12.00%       |              | Buyers Products   |                            | 42.00%       | 25.00%       |
|  |  |  |             |              |              | Moog  |                            | 74.00%       | 25.00%       |
|  |  |  |             |              |              |   |                            |              |              |
| 4  | Body panels, frames, trim, bumper, brackets and associated specialized hardware  | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21    | 12.00%       |              | Buyers Products   |                            | 42.00%       | 25.00%       |
|  |  |  |             |              |              | Dorman Heavy Duty   |                            | 70.00%       | 25.00%       |





| AWARDED VENDORS: |   | <b>Muncie Reclamation and Supply<br/>                     dba Muncie Transit Supply<br/>                     3720 South Madison Street<br/>                     Muncie, IN 47302<br/>                     Contact: Becky Huff<br/>                     765-288-1971<br/>                     bhuff@abc-companies.com</b> |              |                                      |                            | <b>Parts Authority, LLC<br/>                     3 Dakota Drive, Suite 110<br/>                     New Hyde Park, NY 11042<br/>                     Contact: Michael G. Brown<br/>                     570-751-6562<br/>                     fleetbids@partsauthority.com</b> |              |                                      |                            |
|------------------|---|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| Item #           | Description   | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost |
| 9                | Exhaust system parts and accessories and associated specialized hardware                                | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Walker Exhaust   |              | 68.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
| 10               | Fire suppression system parts and accessories and associated specialized hardware                       | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            |
| 11               | Floors, matting and associated specialized hardware   | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            |
| 12               | Fuel system parts and accessories including injectors, tanks, pumps and associated specialized hardware | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 0.00%                                |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            |
|                  |   | EMCO Wheaton Retail/list price no discount   | 01/01/21     |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
| 13               | Gauges, meters, switches, relays, potentiometer and associated specialized hardware                     | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Cole Hearsee   |              | 62.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
| 14               | Glazing, mirrors, visors and associated specialized hardware  | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Trucklite  |              | 70.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Rosco Vision   |              | 63.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Grote  |              | 73.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |   |  |              |                                      |                            | Ecco   |              | 66.00%                               | 25.00%                     |

| AWARDED VENDORS: |  | <b>Muncie Reclamation and Supply<br/>                     dba Muncie Transit Supply<br/>                     3720 South Madison Street<br/>                     Muncie, IN 47302<br/>                     Contact: Becky Huff<br/>                     765-288-1971<br/>                     bhuff@abc-companies.com</b> |              |                                      |                            | <b>Parts Authority, LLC<br/>                     3 Dakota Drive, Suite 110<br/>                     New Hyde Park, NY 11042<br/>                     Contact: Michael G. Brown<br/>                     570-751-6562<br/>                     fleetbids@partsauthority.com</b> |              |                                      |                            |
|------------------|--|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| Item #           | Description  | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost |
| 15               | Lamps/lighting, lenses, signals, brackets and associated specialized hardware (interior and exterior)          | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Phillips Lamps   |              | 76.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
| 16               | Lubricating systems parts and accessories including tanks, fittings, hoses and associated specialized hardware | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
| 17               | Preventive maintenance items including specialized filters and fluids  | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Baldwin Filters  |              | 55.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            | Peak   |              | 67.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            | Pronto Fluids  |              | 35.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
| 18               | Radiators, heater cores, heat exchanger, hoses and associated specialized hardware                             | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Gates  |              | 72.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            | GPD Radiators  |              | 35.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
| 19               | Reflectors, decals, safety items and associated specialized hardware   | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Grote  |              | 73.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            | Ecco   |              | 66.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            | Buyers Products  |              | 42.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|                  |  |  |              |                                      |                            | TruckLite  |              | 70.00%                               | 25.00%                     |



| AWARDED VENDORS:  |  | <b>Muncie Reclamation and Supply<br/>                     dba Muncie Transit Supply<br/>                     3720 South Madison Street<br/>                     Muncie, IN 47302<br/>                     Contact: Becky Huff<br/>                     765-288-1971<br/>                     bhuff@abc-companies.com</b> |              |                                      |                            | <b>Parts Authority, LLC<br/>                     3 Dakota Drive, Suite 110<br/>                     New Hyde Park, NY 11042<br/>                     Contact: Michael G. Brown<br/>                     570-751-6562<br/>                     fleetbids@partsauthority.com</b> |              |                                      |                            |
|---|--|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------|--------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| Item #  | Description  | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost | Catalog Name   | Catalog Date | Minimum % Discount off Catalog Price | Maximum % Markup Over Cost |
| 26  | Wheelchair lifts including parts, accessories and associated specialized hardware              | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            |
| 27  | Windows and doors including parts, accessories and associated specialized hardware             | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | No Bid   |              |                                      |                            |
| 28  | Windshield wipers and washers including parts, accessories and associated specialized hardware | ABC Companies Online Store   | 01/01/21     | 12.00%                               |                            | Trico Windshield Wipers & Supplies   |              | 71.00%                               | 25.00%                     |
|   |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |
| <b>See RFB-DCP-06-21 specifications for detailed terms and conditions</b> |  |  |              |                                      |                            |  |              |                                      |                            |