

**RFB-DCP-13-20**  
**ANNUAL RENTAL OF MACHINERY & EQUIPMENT**  
**Term: April 1, 2020 – March 31, 2021 w/two (2) one (1) year renewal options**  
**EXTENDED THROUGH 03/31/23**

Awarded Vendor Contact Information (1 of 2)

*See attached spreadsheets for awarded items and pricing.  
Refer to bid specifications for detailed terms and conditions.*

<p>Abele Tractor &amp; Equipment Co., Inc.  72 Everett Road  Albany, NY 12205  Contact: Mike Stafford/Lou Taylor  518-438-4444  <a href="mailto:mikes@abeletractor.com">mikes@abeletractor.com</a>  <a href="mailto:ltaylor@abeletractor.com">ltaylor@abeletractor.com</a></p>	<p>Amity Construction Corp.  130 Salt Point Turnpike  MAILING:  24 Haviland Road  Poughkeepsie, NY 12601  Contact: Matthew P. Thompson  845-471-9252  <a href="mailto:info@amityconstructioncorp.com">info@amityconstructioncorp.com</a></p>	<p><del>A. Montano Company, Inc.</del>  <del>571 Route 212</del>  <del>Saugerties, NY 12477</del>  <del>Contact: Larry Hughes</del>  <del>845-247-0206</del>  <a href="mailto:larry@amontanoco.com">larry@amontanoco.com</a></p>
<p>Avello Brothers Contractors, Inc.  60 Fulton Street  Poughkeepsie, NY 12601  Contact: William Avello  845-454-3650  <a href="mailto:abc1947@aol.com">abc1947@aol.com</a></p>	<p>B &amp; K Excavation, Inc.  261 Van Wagner Road  Poughkeepsie, NY 12603  MAILING:  4 Talbot Drive  Pleasant Valley, NY 12569  Contact: Dianne Harrand  845-454-6136  <a href="mailto:bandkexcavation@aol.com">bandkexcavation@aol.com</a></p>	<p>Blacktop Maintenance Corp.  27 Commerce Street  Poughkeepsie, NY 12603  Contact: Stew Petrovits  845-471-8700  <a href="mailto:stewart@btm.construction">stewart@btm.construction</a></p>
<p>Cavaliere Industries, Inc.  226 Selleck Street, Suite C  Stamford, CT 06902  Contact: DJ Cavaliere  203-323-6018  <a href="mailto:dj@cavaliereindustries.com">dj@cavaliereindustries.com</a></p>	<p>Costanzi Crane, Inc.  600 Sawkill Road  Kingston, NY 12401  Contact: Tony Costanzi  845-336-4100  <a href="mailto:info@costanzicrane.com">info@costanzicrane.com</a></p>	<p>Clove Excavators, Inc.  212 Van Wagner Road  Poughkeepsie, NY 12603  Contact: Marc Vumbico/Lisa Wood  845-452-5030  <a href="mailto:lisa@cloveexcavators.com">lisa@cloveexcavators.com</a></p>
<p>Donegal Construction Corp  700 Excel Drive  Hunker, PA 15639  MAILING:  P.O. Box 450  New Stanton, PA 15672  Contact: Todd Hartman  724-423-7500  <a href="mailto:donegal@donegalconstruction.com">donegal@donegalconstruction.com</a></p>	<p><del>Easystreet Cleaning, Inc.</del>  <del>212 Van Wagner Road</del>  <del>Poughkeepsie, NY 12603</del>  <del>Contact: Wayne Simon</del>  <del>845-452-0151</del>  <a href="mailto:customerservice@easystreetcleaning.com">customerservice@easystreetcleaning.com</a></p>	<p>Emerald Equipment Systems, Inc.  7600 Morgan Road  Liverpool, NY 13090  Contact: Brian McCammon  631-553-8628  <a href="mailto:bmccammon@emeraldscreening.com">bmccammon@emeraldscreening.com</a></p>

**RFB-DCP-13-20**  
**ANNUAL RENTAL OF MACHINERY & EQUIPMENT**  
**Term: April 1, 2020 – March 31, 2021 w/two (2) one (1) year renewal options**  
**EXTENDED THROUGH 03/31/23**

Awarded Vendor Contact Information (2 of 2)

*See attached spreadsheets for awarded items and pricing.  
Refer to bid specifications for detailed terms and conditions.*

<p>Fred A. Cook Jr., Inc.  3226 Albany Post Road  Buchanan, NY 10511  MAILING:  P.O. Box 70  Montrose, NY 10548  Contact: Brian F. Cook  914-739-3300  <a href="mailto:bcook@fredcook.com">bcook@fredcook.com</a></p>	<p>Gorman Bros., Inc.  200 Church Street  Albany, NY 12202  Contact: Kimberly Wilson  518-462-5401  <a href="mailto:kwilson@gormanroads.com">kwilson@gormanroads.com</a></p>	<p><del>Here Rentals, Inc.</del>  <del>3 Avis Drive</del>  <del>Latham, NY 12110</del>  <del>Contact: Eric Geiger</del>  <del>518-783-4598</del>  <a href="mailto:herebids@hererentals.com">herebids@hererentals.com</a></p>
<p>Hoffman International, Inc. dba  Hoffman Equipment  1440 Route 9W  Marlboro, NY 12542  Contact: David Koch  845-236-3000  <a href="mailto:dave.koch@hoffmanequip.com">dave.koch@hoffmanequip.com</a></p>	<p>Partner Equipment Rentals, LLC  711 East Chester Street  Kingston, NY 12401  Contact: Ernesto del Aguila  845-330-2524  <a href="mailto:ernesto.delaguila@partnerrentals.com">ernesto.delaguila@partnerrentals.com</a></p>	<p>Peckham Road Corp.  375 Bay Road, Suite 201  Queensbury, NY 12804  Contact: Jen Sablich  914-357-1842  <a href="mailto:jsabl@peckham.com">jsabl@peckham.com</a></p>
<p>Rancourt &amp; Son Land Clearing Corp.  27 Hillside Road  MAILING:  P.O. Box 444  Poughquag, NY 12570  Contact: Peter Rancourt  914-475-6053  <a href="mailto:rancourtlandclearing@gmail.com">rancourtlandclearing@gmail.com</a></p>	<p>Thomas Gleason Inc.  501 Salt Point Turnpike  Poughkeepsie, NY 12603  Contact: Patrick Gleason  845-454-3730  <a href="mailto:estimating@thomasgleasoninc.com">estimating@thomasgleasoninc.com</a></p>	<p>Van Etten Contracting, LLC  229 Union Avenue  New Windsor, NY 12553  MAILING:  P.O. Box 422  Cornwall, NY 12518  Contact: Jerry Paschal  845-518-8962  <a href="mailto:jerry@vecontract.com">jerry@vecontract.com</a></p>
<p>Westchester Tractor, Inc.  60 International Boulevard  Brewster, NY 10509  Contact: Dan Grippo  845-278-7766  <a href="mailto:dan@wtractor.com">dan@wtractor.com</a></p>		

**RFB-DCP-13-20**  
**Rental of Machinery and Equipment**  
**Term: April 1, 2020 - March 31, 2021 w/two (2) one (1) year renewal options**  
**EXTENDED THROUGH 03/31/23**

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
4	Here Rentals	Air Compressor	185 cfm	doosan	p185wd	no bid	\$121.00	\$253.00	\$604.00	no	no	no		\$125.00	\$125.00
1	Hoffman Equipment	Air Compressor	185 cfm	doosan	c185wdo		n/a	\$217.00	\$650.00	no	no	no	\$217.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
1	Partner Equipment Rentals	Air Compressor	185 cfm	atlas copco	xas185	n/a	\$150.00	\$450.00	\$795.00	no	no	no	\$150.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
2	Amity Construction	Air Compressor w/Jack Hammer	185 cfm	atlas copco		\$117.00	\$936.00	\$4,680.00	\$18,720.00	yes	yes	no	\$468.00	\$90.00	\$90.00
2	Avello Brothers Contractors	Air Compressor w/Jack Hammer		ir		\$120.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	\$19,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$960.00	no	no
2	Here Rentals	Air Compressor w/Jack Hammer	185 cfm	doosan	p185wd/90 lb	no bid	\$200.00	\$560.00	\$1,094.00	no	no	no		\$125.00	\$125.00
2	Hoffman Equipment	Air Compressor w/Jack Hammer	185 cfm	doosan	c185wdo		n/a	\$280.00	\$800.00	no	no	no	\$280.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
2	Partner Equipment Rentals	Air Compressor w/Jack Hammer	185 cfm/90	atlas copco	xas185	n/a	\$200.00	\$600.00	\$1,195.00	no	no	no	\$200.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
2	Thomas Gleason	Air Compressor w/Jack Hammer		ingersol rand	185	\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	n/a	yes	yes	no	\$700.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
3	Gorman Bros.	Asphalt Cold Mix Paver		midland	700	\$380.00	\$3,040.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	yes	\$3,040.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
3	Hoffman Equipment	Asphalt Cold Mix Paver		leeboy	8616		\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	\$13,500.00	no	no	no	\$1,500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
3	Peckham Road	Asphalt Cold Mix Paver		cat	ap655f	\$425.00	\$3,400.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$2,080.00	\$485.00	no
4	Hoffman Equipment	Asphalt Curb Forming Machine		miller curber	550e		\$250.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	no	no	no	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
5	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Asphalt Hot Crack Sealer													
6	Blacktop Maintenance	Asphalt Milling Machine 2' to 4'		cat	pm-312	\$455.00	\$3,640.00	\$18,200.00	\$72,800.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
6	Cavaliere Industries	Asphalt Milling Machine 2' to 4'	4'	wirtgen	w120	\$437.50	\$3,500.00	\$15,000.00	\$56,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$3,500.00	\$500.00	no
6	Donegal Construction	Asphalt Milling Machine 2' to 4'		wirtgen	w120	no bid	\$4,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$70,000.00	yes	yes	no	no	\$900.00	\$700.00
6	Hoffman Equipment	Asphalt Milling Machine 2' to 4'		bradco	hp600		\$750.00	\$2,250.00	\$6,750.00	no	no	no	\$750.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
6	Peckham Road	Asphalt Milling Machine 2' to 4'		wirtgen	120f	\$545.00	\$4,360.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$3,000.00	\$850.00	no
7	Cavaliere Industries	Asphalt Milling Machine 7'	7'	wirtgen	w207	\$637.50	\$5,100.00	\$25,000.00	\$100,000.00	yes	yes	yes	\$5,000.00	no	no
7	Donegal Construction	Asphalt Milling Machine 7'		wirtgen	w120	no bid	\$5,200.00	\$26,000.00	\$96,000.00	yes	yes	yes	no	\$900.00	\$700.00
7	Peckham Road	Asphalt Milling Machine 7'		roadtec	rx700	\$700.00	\$5,600.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	yes	\$5,200.00	\$925.00	no
8	Avello Brothers Contractors	Asphalt or Concrete Saw (Self Powered)		target		\$130.00	\$1,040.00	\$5,000.00	\$20,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,040.00	no	no
8	Here Rentals	Asphalt or Concrete Saw (Self Powered)	20 hp	husqvarna	fs524	no bid	\$163.00	\$621.00	\$1,087.00	no	no	no		\$100.00	\$100.00
9	Avello Brothers Contractors	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power	10' to 18'	blawknox	pf4410	\$310.00	\$2,480.00	\$12,400.00	\$48,000.00	yes	yes	yes	\$2,480.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
9	Blacktop Maintenance	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power		cat	ap555f	\$375.00	\$3,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$60,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
9	Clove Excavators	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power		cat	ap655f	\$280.00	\$2,240.00	\$11,200.00	\$44,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,240.00	\$250.00	no
9	Clove Excavators	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power		roadtec	rp195e	\$300.00	\$2,400.00	\$12,000.00	\$48,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,400.00	\$250.00	no
9	Gorman Bros.	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power		cat	1055e	\$475.00	\$3,800.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	yes	\$3,800.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
9	Hoffman Equipment	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power		leeboy	8616		\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	\$13,500.00	no	no	no	\$1,500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
9	Peckham Road	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power		cat	ap1055f	\$475.00	\$3,800.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	yes	\$3,800.00	\$600.00	no
9	Van Etten Contracting	Asphalt Paver Rubber Tire/Self Power		voegele	5100-2	\$350.00	\$1,600.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
10	Gorman Bros.	Asphalt Pugmill		midland	t-6000	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,800.00	\$600.00	\$600.00
10	Peckham Road	Asphalt Pugmill		midland	t-4100	\$235.00	\$1,880.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,880.00	\$400.00	no

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
11	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton	n/a	bomag	bw-120	no bid	\$200.00	\$570.00	\$1,590.00	dsl	no	no	n/a	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
<del>11</del>	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton</del>		<del>sakai</del>	<del>sw300</del>	<del>-</del>	<del>\$275.00</del>	<del>\$1,000.00</del>	<del>\$3,000.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>
11	Avello Brothers Contractors	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton	3 ton	bomag	128d	\$130.00	\$1,040.00	\$5,200.00	\$20,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,040.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
11	Blacktop Maintenance	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton		cat	cb-44	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	\$31,200.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
11	Clove Excavators	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton		hamm	hd14	\$130.00	\$1,040.00	\$5,200.00	\$20,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,040.00	\$250.00	no
11	Gorman Bros.	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton		hamm	110	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,200.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
<del>11</del>	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton</del>	<del>3 ton</del>	<del>volvo</del>	<del>dd25bw</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$290.00</del>	<del>\$690.00</del>	<del>\$1,754.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>-</del>	<del>\$125.00</del>	<del>\$125.00</del>
11	Hoffman Equipment	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton		case	dv36		\$350.00	\$1,050.00	\$3,150.00	no	no	no	\$350.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
11	Partner Equipment Rentals	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton	3 ton	chicago pneu	ar120	n/a	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	no	no	no	\$250.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
11	Peckham Road	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton		hamm	hd-12	\$155.00	\$1,240.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$850.00	\$350.00	no
11	Van Etten Contracting	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 3 - 6 Ton		hamm	hd14i	\$160.00	\$1,280.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,280.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
12	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton	n/a	dynapac	cc522	no bid	\$420.00	\$1,100.00	\$2,990.00	dsl	no	no	n/a	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
<del>12</del>	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton</del>		<del>sakai</del>	<del>sw850</del>		<del>\$400.00</del>	<del>\$1,200.00</del>	<del>\$3,600.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>
12	Avello Brothers Contractors	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton	10 - 12 ton	tampo	r166a	\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,240.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
12	Blacktop Maintenance	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton		cat	cb-534	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	\$31,200.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
12	Clove Excavators	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton		cat	cb10	\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	\$24,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,240.00	\$250.00	no
12	Clove Excavators	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton		hamm	hd110hv	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,200.00	\$250.00	no
12	Gorman Bros.	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton		hamm	120	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,400.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
12	Hoffman Equipment	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton		case	dv210		\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,600.00	no	no	no	\$400.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
12	Peckham Road	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton		hamm	hd-120	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$850.00	\$600.00	no
12	Van Etten Contracting	Asphalt Roller Vibrator 8 - 12 Ton		hamm	hd90	\$200.00	\$1,280.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,280.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
13	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Backhoe Loaders, Other	n/a	cat	420	no bid	\$225.00	\$590.00	\$1,600.00	dsl	no	no	n/a	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
13	Amity Construction	Backhoe Loaders, Other	1 yd	case	580 sm	\$151.00	\$1,208.00	\$6,040.00	\$24,160.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$100.00	\$100.00
<del>13</del>	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Backhoe Loaders, Other</del>		<del>cat</del>	<del>420</del>		<del>\$300.00</del>	<del>\$900.00</del>	<del>\$2,700.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>
13	B & K Excavation	Backhoe Loaders, Other	1.75	cat	430e	\$160.00	\$1,280.00	\$6,400.00	\$25,600.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	no
13	Blacktop Maintenance	Backhoe Loaders, Other		cat	420	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
13	Clove Excavators	Backhoe Loaders, Other		case	580	\$125.00	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$25,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,000.00	\$250.00	no
<del>13</del>	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Backhoe Loaders, Other</del>		<del>case</del>	<del>580</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$443.00</del>	<del>\$1,380.00</del>	<del>\$2,300.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>		<del>\$175.00</del>	<del>\$175.00</del>
13	Hoffman Equipment	Backhoe Loaders, Other		case	580sn/590sn		\$450.00	\$1,350.00	\$4,050.00	no	no	no	\$450.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
13	Partner Equipment Rentals	Backhoe Loaders, Other		jcb	3cx	n/a	\$350.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,250.00	no	no	no	\$350.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
13	Thomas Gleason	Backhoe Loaders, Other	1 cu yd	john deere	310	\$196.00	\$1,568.00	\$7,840.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$750.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
13	Westchester Tractor	Backhoe Loaders, Other	1.3	new holland	b95	n/a	\$285.00	\$800.00	\$2,400.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
14	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer	n/a	kubota	ssv-75	no bid	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$2,150.00	dsl	no	no	n/a	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
<del>14</del>	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer</del>		<del>takeuchi</del>	<del>tl-8</del>		<del>\$385.00</del>	<del>\$1,100.00</del>	<del>\$3,300.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>
14	B & K Excavation	Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer		cat/kubota	277	\$140.00	\$1,120.00	\$5,600.00	\$22,400.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$110.00/hr	no
14	Clove Excavators	Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer		cat	252b	\$120.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	\$19,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$960.00	\$250.00	no
<del>14</del>	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer</del>		<del>kubota</del>	<del>ssv-75</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$313.00</del>	<del>\$736.00</del>	<del>\$1,613.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>		<del>\$150.00</del>	<del>\$150.00</del>
14	Hoffman Equipment	Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer		case	sv300		\$250.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	no	no	no	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
14	Partner Equipment Rentals	Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer		volvo	mc110d	n/a	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$1,750.00	no	no	no	\$250.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
14	Thomas Gleason	Backhoe Loaders, Skid Steer	1/2 cu yd	bobcat	s300	\$181.00	\$1,448.00	\$7,240.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$750.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
15	Easystreet Cleaning	Catch Basin Cleaner (Truck Mounted)		vacall	e10	\$205.00	\$1,640.00	\$8,200.00	\$32,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,640.00	no	no
15	Fred A. Cook, Jr.	Catch Basin Cleaner (Truck Mounted)	12 - 15	vactor	2100	\$189.00	\$1,515.00	\$7,595.00	\$24,995.00	yes	yes	no	no	no	no
16	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Chipper Brush (Wheel Mtd. / Tow Type)	n/a	morbark	1821	no bid	\$300.00	\$900.00	\$2,275.00	dsl	no	no	n/a	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
16	A. Montano	Chipper Brush (Wheel Mtd. / Tow Type)		morbark	12"		\$375.00	\$1,400.00	\$4,200.00	no	no	no	no	\$400.00	\$400.00
16	Here Rentals	Chipper Brush (Wheel Mtd. / Tow Type)	12"	vermeer	bc1000xl	no bid	\$491.00	\$1,257.00	\$2,530.00	no	no	no		\$150.00	\$150.00
16	Partner Equipment Rentals	Chipper Brush (Wheel Mtd. / Tow Type)	12"	vermeer	bc1000xl	n/a	\$300.00	\$900.00	\$2,250.00	no	no	no	\$300.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
16	Westchester Tractor	Chipper Brush (Wheel Mtd. / Tow Type)	12"	bandit	250xl	n/a	\$350.00	\$1,050.00	\$3,150.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
17	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Crane (Truck)													
18	Hoffman Equipment	Cranes (All Terrain)		grove	grt655		n/a	n/a	\$12,000.00				\$12,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00
19	Hoffman Equipment	Cranes (Boom Truck)		national	nbt50		n/a	n/a	\$18,000.00	no	no	no	\$18,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00
20	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Dozer D-8 Class w/Ripper	n/a	cat	d8t	no bid	\$2,100.00	\$6,300.00	\$13,000.00	dsl	no	no	n/a	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
20	A. Montano	Dozer D-8 Class w/Ripper		eat	d8t		\$1,750.00	\$5,000.00	\$14,000.00	no	no	no	no	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
21	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hammer & Compressor (Track Drill)													
22	A. Montano	Hydraulic Excavator with sheet poulder		hyundai	210		\$1,150.00	\$4,600.00	\$12,500.00	no	no	no	no	\$600.00	\$600.00
22	Hoffman Equipment	Hydraulic Excavator with sheet poulder		doosan	x235r/ptc7ph		n/a	\$3,700.00	\$11,500.00	no	no	no	\$3,700.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00
23	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd Tire Mtd.	n/a	cat	322d	no bid	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	\$4,500.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
23	Amity Construction	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd Tire Mtd.	40,000 lbs	hyundai	w170	\$186.00	\$1,488.00	\$7,440.00	\$29,760.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$100.00	\$100.00
23	A. Montano	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd Tire Mtd.		hyundai	210w		\$500.00	\$1,900.00	\$5,600.00	no	no	no	no	\$600.00	\$600.00
23	Hoffman Equipment	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd Tire Mtd.		volvo	ew150		n/a	\$1,900.00	\$5,500.00	no	no	no	\$1,900.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
23	Thomas Gleason	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd Tire Mtd.	40,000 lbs	john deere	220dw (tire)	\$241.00	\$1,928.00	\$9,640.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$1,000.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
23	Van Etten Contracting	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd Tire Mtd.		komatsu	138	\$170.00	\$1,360.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,360.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
24	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd	30,000 lbs	sany	sy135	no bid	\$300.00	\$900.00	\$2,700.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
24	Amity Construction	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd	50,000 lbs	hyundai	235	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	\$31,200.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
24	A. Montano	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd		hyundai	220		\$500.00	\$1,900.00	\$5,600.00	no	no	no	no	\$600.00	\$600.00
24	B & K Excavation	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd	36,000 lbs	daewoo	175	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
24	Blacktop Maintenance	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd		john deere	240	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
24	Clove Excavators	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd		komatsu	pc78	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,800.00	\$23,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,160.00	\$250.00	no
24	Clove Excavators	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd		komatsu	pc200	\$180.00	\$1,440.00	\$7,200.00	\$28,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,440.00	\$250.00	no
24	Here Rentals	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd	9 ton	bobcat	e85	no bid	\$619.00	\$1,489.00	\$3,306.00	no	no	no		\$175.00	\$175.00
24	Hoffman Equipment	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd		case	cx160		\$500.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,450.00	no	no	no	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
24	Partner Equipment Rentals	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd	30,000 lbs	volvo	ec140el	n/a	\$650.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,500.00	no	no	no	\$650.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
24	Thomas Gleason	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd	56,000 lbs	john deere	225	\$241.00	\$1,928.00	\$9,640.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$1,000.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
24	Van Etten Contracting	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd		komatsu	228	\$200.00	\$1,600.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
24	Westchester Tractor	Hydraulic Excavators Track Mtd		kobelco	sk140	n/a	\$500.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
25	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hydraulic Rock Breakers													

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
26	Clove Excavators	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator	5,000 lbs	komatsu	pc200	\$310.00	\$2,480.00	\$12,400.00	\$49,600.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,480.00	\$250.00	no
26	Clove Excavators	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator	7,500 lbs	komatsu	pc308	\$440.00	\$3,520.00	\$17,600.00	\$70,400.00	yes	yes	no	\$3,520.00	\$250.00	no
26	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator</del>	<del>1,200 lbs</del>	<del>ken</del>	<del>9fsp-wr</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$409.00</del>	<del>\$1,165.00</del>	<del>\$2,395.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>		<del>\$100.00</del>	<del>\$100.00</del>
26	Thomas Gleason	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator	5,000 lbs	john deere	200	\$351.00	\$2,808.00	\$14,040.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$1,500.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
27	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator	48,000 lbs	sany	sy215	no bid	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$12,000.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
27	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator</del>		<del>hyundai</del>	<del>220</del>		<del>\$1,150.00</del>	<del>\$4,600.00</del>	<del>\$12,500.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$600.00</del>	<del>\$600.00</del>
27	Hoffman Equipment	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator		case	cx145		n/a	\$3,000.00	\$8,800.00	no	no	no	\$3,000.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
27	Partner Equipment Rentals	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator	2,000 lbs	epiroc	ec110t	n/a	\$400.00	\$1,100.00	\$3,000.00	no	no	no	\$400.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
27	Thomas Gleason	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator	10,000 lbs	cat	330	\$531.00	\$4,248.00	\$21,240.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
27	Westchester Tractor	Hydraulic Rock Breakers-Excavator	4,000 lbs	kobelco	sk230	n/a	\$1,445.00	\$4,335.00	\$13,000.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
28	Amity Construction	Hydraulic Rock Breakers (Backhoe/Boom Mtd.)	1,600 lbs	john deere	310 sg	\$192.00	\$1,536.00	\$7,680.00	\$30,720.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$100.00	\$100.00
28	Blacktop Maintenance	Hydraulic Rock Breakers (Backhoe/Boom Mtd.)		cat	446	\$300.00	\$2,400.00	\$12,000.00	\$48,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
28	Hoffman Equipment	Hydraulic Rock Breakers (Backhoe/Boom Mtd.)		case	580sn/590sn		n/a	\$1,400.00	\$4,200.00	no	no	no	\$1,400.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
28	Partner Equipment Rentals	Hydraulic Rock Breakers (Backhoe/Boom Mtd.)	1,000 lbs	stryker	tnb6m	n/a	\$300.00	\$900.00	\$2,700.00	no	no	no	\$300.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
28	Thomas Gleason	Hydraulic Rock Breakers (Backhoe/Boom Mtd.)	3,000 lbs	john deere	710d	\$301.00	\$2,408.00	\$12,040.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$1,500.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
29	Fred A. Cook, Jr.	Jet Rodder (Conduit Cleaner) Truck Mounted	12-15	vactor	2100	\$197.00	\$1,576.00	\$7,495.00	\$24,995.00	yes	yes	no	no	no	no
30	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Message Board Solar</del>		<del>wanco</del>	<del>wtlmb-a</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$190.00</del>	<del>\$483.00</del>	<del>\$914.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>		<del>\$100.00</del>	<del>\$100.00</del>
31	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Message Board Variable													
32	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Mower Boom (Tractor Mtd. Hyd. Mounted)	n/a	sweeper	sweeper		\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,600.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
32	Westchester Tractor	Mower Boom (Tractor Mtd. Hyd. Mounted)		kubota	m6	n/a	\$800.00	\$2,400.00	\$7,200.00	no	no	no	\$2,400.00	n/a	n/a
33	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Mower Ditchbank Roadside (Tractor)													
34	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Portable Pumps 6"													
35	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Portable Pumps 8"													
36	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Portable Pumps 10"													
37	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hose for the above pump 6inchx50ft													
38	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hose for the above pump 6inchx20ft													
39	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hose for the above pump 8inchx50ft													
40	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hose for the above pump 8inchx20ft													
41	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hose for the above pump 10inchx50ft													
42	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Hose for the above pump 10inchx20ft													
43	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Pump 6 IN Trash													
44	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Road Grader	n/a	cat	140m	no bid	\$700.00	\$2,100.00	\$6,000.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
44	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Road Grader</del>		<del>cat</del>	<del>140k</del>		<del>\$500.00</del>	<del>\$1,600.00</del>	<del>\$4,800.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$600.00</del>	<del>\$600.00</del>
44	Blacktop Maintenance	Road Grader		cat	120	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
44	Clove Excavators	Road Grader		cat	120	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,200.00	\$250.00	no
44	Gorman Bros.	Road Grader		champion	720a	\$210.00	\$1,680.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,680.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
44	Peckham Road	Road Grader		cat	120m2	\$240.00	\$1,920.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,200.00	\$575.00	no
44	Van Etten Contracting	Road Grader		leeboy	635	\$200.00	\$1,600.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
45	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Road Maintainer													
46	Blacktop Maintenance	Road Widener (Self Powered / tow Type)		midland		\$225.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
46	Clove Excavators	Road Widener (Self Powered / tow Type)		midland	960	\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$6,800.00	\$27,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,360.00	\$250.00	no
46	Peckham Road	Road Widener (Self Powered / tow Type)		midland	sp8	\$245.00	\$1,960.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,960.00	\$750.00	no
47	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track	n/a	cat	930k	no bid	\$425.00	\$1,150.00	\$3,400.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
47	Amity Construction	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track	2.5 cy	kawasaki	65 tm	\$182.00	\$1,456.00	\$7,280.00	\$29,120.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$100.00	\$100.00
47	Blacktop Maintenance	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track		cat	930	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
47	Clove Excavators	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track	3 yds	john deere	544	\$140.00	\$1,120.00	\$5,600.00	\$22,400.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,120.00	\$250.00	no
47	Clove Excavators	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track	1.25	cat	906	\$130.00	\$1,040.00	\$5,200.00	\$20,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,040.00	\$250.00	no
47	Hoffman Equipment	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track		case	621g		\$530.00	\$1,585.00	\$4,760.00	no	no	no	\$530.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
47	Thomas Gleason	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track	4 cy	john deere	644h	\$241.00	\$1,928.00	\$9,640.00	n/a	no	yes	no	\$1,000.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
47	Westchester Tractor	Rubber Tire Front End Loader/Crawler Track	1	kubota	r630	n/a	\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,600.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
48	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Skidsteer Loader w/miller	n/a	kubota	ssv-75	no bid	\$600.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,500.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
48	Avello Brothers Contractors	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		bobcat		\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,240.00	no	no
48	B & K Excavation	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		cat/kubota	277	\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$6,800.00	\$27,200.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$110.00/hr	no
48	Blacktop Maintenance	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		case		\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
48	Clove Excavators	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		new holland	1185	\$180.00	\$1,440.00	\$7,200.00	\$28,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,440.00	\$250.00	no
48	Here Rentals	Skidsteer Loader w/miller	14"	kubota/bobcat	ssv-75/m7019	no bid	\$577.00	\$1,794.00	\$4,258.00	no	no	no		\$175.00	\$175.00
48	Hoffman Equipment	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		bradco	hp600		\$750.00	\$2,250.00	\$6,750.00	no	no	no	\$750.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
48	Partner Equipment Rentals	Skidsteer Loader w/miller	2,250 lbs	volvo	mc110d	n/a	\$450.00	\$1,350.00	\$4,050.00	no	no	no	\$450.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
48	Peckham Road	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		bobcat	s630	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,560.00	\$375.00	no
48	Van Etten Contracting	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		bobcat	a770	\$200.00	\$1,280.00			yes	yes	yes		\$300.00	\$300.00
48	Westchester Tractor	Skidsteer Loader w/miller		new holland	1230	n/a	\$535.00	\$1,605.00	\$4,810.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
49	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket	n/a	kubota	ssv-75	no bid	\$600.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,500.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
49	A. Montano	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket		takeuchi	tl-12		\$560.00	\$2,240.00	\$6,720.00	no	no	no	no	\$400.00	\$400.00
49	B & K Excavation	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket		cat/kubota	277	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,800.00	\$23,200.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$110.00/hr	no
49	Blacktop Maintenance	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket		case		\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
49	Here Rentals	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket	14"	kubota/bobcat	ssv-75/m7019	no bid	\$577.00	\$1,794.00	\$4,258.00	no	no	no		\$175.00	\$175.00

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
49	Hoffman Equipment	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket		bradco	hp600		\$750.00	\$2,250.00	\$6,750.00	no	no	no	\$750.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
49	Partner Equipment Rentals	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket	2,250 lbs	volvo	mc110d	n/a	\$450.00	\$1,350.00	\$4,050.00	no	no	no	\$450.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
49	Peckham Road	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket		bobcat	s630	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,560.00	\$375.00	no
49	Van Etten Contracting	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket		bobcat	a770	\$225.00	\$1,280.00			yes	yes	yes		\$300.00	\$300.00
49	Westchester Tractor	Skidsteer Loader w/miller w/Bucket		new holland	l230	n/a	\$535.00	\$1,605.00	\$4,810.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
50	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Soil Screener	n/a	xtec-robotrac	xtec	no bid	\$1,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
50	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Soil Screener</del>		<del>revolver</del>	<del>rt508</del>		<del>\$500.00</del>	<del>\$2,000.00</del>	<del>\$6,000.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>
50	Blacktop Maintenance	Soil Screener		powerscreen		\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	yes	no	16 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
50	Clove Excavators	Soil Screener		kohlberg	kr10	\$165.00	\$1,320.00	\$6,600.00	\$26,400.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,320.00	\$250.00	no
50	Emerald Equipment Systems	Soil Screener	100	terex/evoquip	colt 1000	n/a	n/a	n/a	\$10,000.00	no	no	no	no	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
50	Hoffman Equipment	Soil Screener		kpi-jci	gt104	n/a	n/a	n/a	\$7,500.00	no	no	no	\$7,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00
50	Westchester Tractor	Soil Screener	3	vibroscreen	scm40	n/a	\$500.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
51	Gorman Bros.	Stone Aggregate Spreaders (Self Powered)		bearcat	2002	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	no bid	no bid		yes		\$1,800.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
51	Peckham Road	Stone Aggregate Spreaders (Self Powered)		etnyre	4wd	\$385.00	\$3,080.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$2,400.00	\$675.00	no
52	<del>A. Montano</del>	<del>Stump Grinder w/ Tow Vehicle</del>		<del>rayco</del>	<del>rg740</del>		<del>\$675.00</del>	<del>\$2,000.00</del>	<del>\$6,000.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>	<del>\$400.00</del>
52	Partner Equipment Rentals	Stump Grinder w/ Tow Vehicle	on trailer	vermeer	sc290	n/a	\$285.00	\$855.00	\$2,140.00	no	no	no	\$285.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
53	Abele Tractor & Equipment	Sweeper Broom Type	n/a	leeboy	sweep pro	no bid	\$300.00	\$900.00	\$2,500.00	dsl	no	no	no bid	\$125.00/hr	\$125.00/hr
53	B & K Excavation	Sweeper Broom Type		cat/kubota	277	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$110.00/hr	no
53	Clove Excavators	Sweeper Broom Type		sweepster	rd2	\$115.00	\$920.00	\$4,600.00	\$18,400.00	yes	yes	no	\$920.00	\$250.00	no
53	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Sweeper Broom Type</del>		<del>laymore</del>	<del>sm300</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$321.00</del>	<del>\$764.00</del>	<del>\$1,742.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>		<del>\$150.00</del>	<del>\$150.00</del>
53	Hoffman Equipment	Sweeper Broom Type		roscoe	rb-50		\$350.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,200.00	no	no	no	\$350.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
53	Peckham Road	Sweeper Broom Type		new holland	tn55	\$135.00	\$1,080.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,080.00	\$375.00	no
54	<del>Easystreet Cleaning</del>	<del>Sweeper Power Pavement Truck Mounted</del>		<del>elgen-broombaire</del>	<del>f142h</del>	<del>\$205.00</del>	<del>\$1,640.00</del>	<del>\$8,200.00</del>	<del>\$32,800.00</del>	<del>yes</del>	<del>yes</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$1,640.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>
54	Hoffman Equipment	Sweeper Power Pavement Truck Mounted		stewart-amos	s4		n/a	n/a	\$9,500.00	no	no	no	\$9,500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
55	<del>Easystreet Cleaning</del>	<del>Sweeper Vacuum Type Street-</del>		<del>elgen-broombaire</del>	<del>f142h</del>	<del>\$205.00</del>	<del>\$1,640.00</del>	<del>\$8,200.00</del>	<del>\$32,800.00</del>	<del>yes</del>	<del>yes</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>\$1,640.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>
56	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Trencher-</del>		<del>ditchwitch</del>	<del>e24x</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$224.00</del>	<del>\$621.00</del>	<del>\$1,029.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>		<del>\$100.00</del>	<del>\$100.00</del>
56	Partner Equipment Rentals	Trencher	track 30"	toro	tx525	n/a	\$300.00	\$900.00	\$2,250.00	no	no	no	\$300.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
57	<del>Here Rentals</del>	<del>Truck - 10 Wheel Dump</del>		<del>freightliner</del>	<del>m2-106</del>	<del>no bid</del>	<del>\$737.00</del>	<del>\$2,409.00</del>	<del>\$5,635.00</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>	<del>no</del>		<del>\$175.00</del>	<del>\$175.00</del>
58	Avello Brothers Contractors	Truck - 18+ Wheel Flowboy Tractor/Trailer	39 ton	mack	flowboy	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,600.00	\$22,400.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,160.00	no	no
58	Blacktop Maintenance	Truck - 18+ Wheel Flowboy Tractor/Trailer	35 ton			\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	no	no
58	Clove Excavators	Truck - 18+ Wheel Flowboy Tractor/Trailer	40 ton			\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$6,800.00	\$27,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,360.00	no	no
58	Gorman Bros.	Truck - 18+ Wheel Flowboy Tractor/Trailer	35 ton	flowboy	cb4000	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,200.00		
58	Peckham Road	Truck - 18+ Wheel Flowboy Tractor/Trailer		various	various	\$135.00	\$1,080.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	no	\$810.00	no	no
59	Blacktop Maintenance	Truck - Dump Tractor Trailer	35 ton			\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	no	no



1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
59	Clove Excavators	Truck - Dump Tractor Trailer	40 ton			\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,200.00	no	no
59	Thomas Gleason	Truck - Dump Tractor Trailer	3cy - 32 ton	international	7600	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	n/a	yes	yes	no	\$850.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
60	B & K Excavation	Truck - Flat Bed Tractor Trailer	1 ton	ford	f550	\$115.00	\$920.00	\$4,600.00	\$18,400.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	no	no
60	Blacktop Maintenance	Truck - Flat Bed Tractor Trailer	50 ton			\$160.00	\$1,280.00	\$6,400.00	\$25,600.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	no	no
60	Clove Excavators	Truck - Flat Bed Tractor Trailer	35 ton			\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,200.00	no	no
61	B & K Excavation	Truck - Other Tractor/Trailers	50 ton	kenworth		\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	\$24,800.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	no	no
62	Amity Construction	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump	22 ton	various		\$140.00	\$1,120.00	\$5,600.00	\$22,400.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	no	no
62	Avello Brothers Contractors	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump	23 ton	mack	rd	\$120.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	\$19,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$960.00	no	no
62	B & K Excavation	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump	22 ton	kenworth/cat		\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,800.00	\$23,200.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	no	no
62	Blacktop Maintenance	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump	25 ton			\$140.00	\$1,120.00	\$5,600.00	\$22,400.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	no	no
62	Clove Excavators	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump	18 yds			\$120.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	\$19,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$960.00	no	no
62	Gorman Bros.	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump	22 ton	mack	gu713	\$125.00	\$1,000.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,000.00		
62	Peckham Road	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump		various	various	\$115.00	\$920.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	no	\$690.00	no	no
62	Thomas Gleason	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump	16 cy	international	paystar	\$180.00	\$1,440.00	\$7,200.00	n/a	yes	yes	no	\$800.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
62	Van Etten Contracting	Truck - Tri-Axle Dump				\$160.00	\$1,280.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,280.00	no	no
63	<b>NO BIDS RECEIVED</b>	Tub Grinder													
		<b>OTHER MACHINERY</b>													
64	Amity Construction	dozer		john deere	450 j	\$146.00	\$1,168.00	\$5,840.00	\$23,360.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$250.00	no
65	Amity Construction	soil roller		case	602	\$130.00	\$1,040.00	\$5,200.00	\$20,800.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$250.00	no
66	Amity Construction	rubber track skid steer		john deere	317 g	\$129.00	\$1,032.00	\$5,160.00	\$20,640.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	no
67	Amity Construction	excavator Rubber Track	12,000 lbs	hyundai	55	\$153.00	\$1,224.00	\$6,120.00	\$24,480.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	no
68	Amity Construction	excavator Rubber Track	18,000 lbs	hyundai	80	\$154.00	\$1,232.00	\$6,160.00	\$24,640.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$250.00	no
69	Amity Construction	excavator/Truck Mid	30,000 lbs	hyundai	140 hx	\$159.00	\$1,272.00	\$6,360.00	\$25,440.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
70	Avello Brothers Contractors	laborer/racker/screedman				\$115.00	\$920.00	\$4,600.00	\$18,400.00	no	no	no	\$920.00	no	no
71	B & K Excavation	6-wheel dump	4 yd	ford	f550	\$105.00	\$840.00	\$4,200.00	\$16,800.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	no	no
72	B & K Excavation	site truck		moxy/terex	27ta	\$165.00	\$1,320.00	\$6,600.00	\$26,400.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
73	B & K Excavation	1 ton truck w/ 9' plow		ford	f550	\$110.00	\$880.00	\$4,400.00	\$17,600.00	yes	yes	no	6 hrs	no	no
74	B & K Excavation	labor/flagperson				\$108.00	\$864.00	\$4,320.00	\$17,280.00	no	yes	no	4 hrs	no	no
75	B & K Excavation	excavator		kubota	kx80	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
76	B & K Excavation	excavator	36,000 lbs	daewoo	175	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
77	B & K Excavation	excavator	48,000 lbs	daewoo	225	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
78	B & K Excavation	excavator	72,000 lbs	daewoo	340	\$255.00	\$2,040.00	\$10,200.00	\$40,800.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$205.00/hr	\$205.00/hr
79	B & K Excavation	excavator with hammer	52,000 lbs	cat	325	\$285.00	\$2,280.00	\$11,400.00	\$45,600.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
80	B & K Excavation	bulldozer		cat	d3	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,800.00	\$23,200.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	no
81	B & K Excavation	bulldozer		cat	d5	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	no
82	B & K Excavation	loader	3 yd	daewoo	200	\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$6,800.00	\$27,200.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	no
83	B & K Excavation	loader with 4 in 1 bucket	3 yd	daewoo	200	\$180.00	\$1,440.00	\$7,200.00	\$28,800.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	no
84	B & K Excavation	skid steer with grapper bucket		cat/kubota	277	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,800.00	\$23,200.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$110.00/hr	no
85	B & K Excavation	roller		intensus		\$140.00	\$1,120.00	\$5,600.00	\$22,400.00	no	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
86	B & K Excavation	roller - remote walk behind		wacker			\$255.00	\$1,275.00	\$5,100.00	no	yes	no	4 hrs	no	no

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
87	B & K Excavation	roller		bomag		\$120.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	\$19,200.00	no	yes	no	4 hrs	\$110.00/hr	no
88	B & K Excavation	skid steer with rake or broom		kubota	277	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
89	B & K Excavation	excavator		cat	325	\$215.00	\$1,720.00	\$8,600.00	\$34,400.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
90	B & K Excavation	excavator with hammer		kubota	kx80	\$210.00	\$1,680.00	\$8,400.00	\$33,600.00	yes	yes	no	4 hrs	\$155.00/hr	\$155.00/hr
91	Blacktop Maintenance	dozer		cat	d-7	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
92	Blacktop Maintenance	dozer		cat	d-5	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	\$31,200.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
93	Blacktop Maintenance	roller		cat	433	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	\$31,200.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
94	Blacktop Maintenance	roller		bomag	bw-190	\$160.00	\$1,280.00	\$6,400.00	\$25,600.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	no	no
95	Blacktop Maintenance	water truck		international		\$125.00	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$20,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	no	no
96	Blacktop Maintenance	crusher		eagle	500-05cc	\$500.00	\$4,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$80,000.00	yes	yes	no	24 hrs	\$500.00	\$500.00
97	Blacktop Maintenance	excavator		volvo	240	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
98	Blacktop Maintenance	excavator		cat	303.5	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	yes	no	8 hrs	\$200.00	\$200.00
99	Clove Excavators	skid steer		new holland	1185	\$120.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	\$19,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$960.00	\$250.00	no
100	Clove Excavators	skid steer		cat	257	\$130.00	\$1,040.00	\$5,200.00	\$20,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,040.00	\$250.00	no
101	Clove Excavators	skid steer		cat	299	\$135.00	\$1,080.00	\$5,400.00	\$21,600.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,080.00	\$250.00	no
102	Clove Excavators	van - pipe/paving				\$37.50	\$300.00	\$1,500.00	\$6,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$300.00	no	no
103	Clove Excavators	bulldozer		dresser	td7h	\$120.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	\$19,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$960.00	no	no
104	Clove Excavators	vacuum excavator		vermeer	vactron	\$350.00	\$2,800.00	\$14,000.00	\$56,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,800.00	\$250.00	no
105	Clove Excavators	bulldozer		cat	d6m	\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	\$24,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,240.00	\$250.00	no
106	Clove Excavators	bulldozer		international	td15	\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	\$24,800.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,240.00	\$250.00	no
107	Clove Excavators	bulldozer		cat	d3k	\$135.00	\$1,080.00	\$5,400.00	\$21,600.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,080.00	\$250.00	no
108	Clove Excavators	excavator		cat	305e	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,800.00	\$23,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,160.00	\$250.00	no
109	Clove Excavators	excavator		komatsu	pc308	\$265.00	\$2,120.00	\$10,600.00	\$42,400.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,120.00	\$250.00	no
110	Clove Excavators	excavator		komatsu	pc138	\$160.00	\$1,280.00	\$6,400.00	\$25,600.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,280.00	\$250.00	no
111	Clove Excavators	excavator		komatsu	pc360	\$325.00	\$2,600.00	\$13,000.00	\$52,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,600.00	\$250.00	no
112	Clove Excavators	excavator		bobcat	435	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$5,800.00	\$23,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,160.00	\$250.00	no
113	Clove Excavators	screed/labor				\$100.00	\$800.00	\$4,000.00	\$16,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$800.00	no	no
114	Clove Excavators	hydraulic rock breaker excavator	8,000 lbs	komatsu	pc360	\$520.00	\$4,160.00	\$20,800.00	\$83,200.00	yes	yes	no	\$4,160.00	\$500.00	no
115	Costanzi Crane		40 ton	national	18127		\$2,400.00			yes	yes	no	\$2,400.00	no	no
116	Costanzi Crane		70 ton	link belt	htc86100		\$2,900.00			yes	yes	no	\$2,900.00	no	no
117	Costanzi Crane		100 ton	link belt	htc86100		\$3,700.00			yes	yes	yes	\$3,700.00	no	no
118	Costanzi Crane		115 ton	grove	gmk4115		\$4,100.00			yes	yes	yes	\$4,100.00	no	no
119	Costanzi Crane		150 ton	grove	gmk5275		\$5,300.00			yes	yes	yes	\$5,300.00	no	no
120	Costanzi Crane		200 ton	grove	gmk5275		\$7,100.00			yes	yes	yes	\$7,100.00	no	no
121	Costanzi Crane		275 ton	grove	gmk5275		\$9,200.00			yes	yes	yes	\$9,200.00	no	no
122	Costanzi Crane		350 ton	grove	gmk6350		\$12,500.00			yes	yes	yes	\$12,500.00	no	no
123	Fred A. Cook, Jr.	hydro excavator	12	ram vac	hx-12	\$325.00	\$2,600.00	\$12,000.00	\$44,000.00	yes	yes	yes	no	no	no
124	Fred A. Cook, Jr.	TV truck		aries		\$300.00	\$2,400.00	\$12,000.00	\$48,000.00	yes	yes	yes	no	no	no
125	Gorman Bros.	reclaimer		wirtgen	2500	\$688.00	\$5,504.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$5,504.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
126	Gorman Bros.	foreman utility vehicle		ford	2500	no bid	\$200.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$200.00		

1	VENDOR	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT	CU. YD. CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 Week Rate	Fuel Included with Equipment YES OR NO	Operator included YES OR NO	Helper YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$	PICK UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$\$
127	Gorman Bros.	rubber tire roller		hamm	grw280	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,400.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
128	Gorman Bros.	calcium spray trailer		polar	mrx9	\$140.00	\$1,200.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,200.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
129	Gorman Bros.	pad foot roller		hamm	3412	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,400.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
130	Gorman Bros.	soil compactor		hamm	h111	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,400.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
131	Gorman Bros.	asphalt emulsion distributor		kenworth	t880	\$180.00	\$1,440.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,440.00		
132	Peckham Road	reclaimer		cat	rm350b	\$685.00	\$5,480.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$4,800.00	\$850.00	no
133	Peckham Road	paving van		ford		no bid	\$185.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$185.00	no	no
134	Peckham Road	labor/screedman/flagger				\$785.00	\$6,280.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$5,800.00	no	no
135	Peckham Road	calcium trailer	5,000 gallon	etnyre		\$165.00	\$1,320.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	no	\$1,320.00	no	no
136	Peckham Road	rack truck		12020		\$325.00	\$2,600.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$2,200.00	no	no
137	Peckham Road	pneumatic rubber tire roller		roscoe	915rt	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	no bid	no bid	no	yes	no	\$1,200.00	\$450.00	no
138	Peckham Road	distributor	4,000 gallon	etnyre		\$165.00	\$1,320.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	no	\$1,320.00	no	no
139	Rancourt & Son Land Clearing	track mounted horizontal tub grinder		vermeer	hg525tx	\$375.00	\$3,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$50,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$6,000.00	no	no
140	Rancourt & Son Land Clearing	trailer mounted horizontal tub grinder		vermeer	hg4000	\$375.00	\$3,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$50,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$6,000.00	no	no
141	Rancourt & Son Land Clearing	excavator with stump shear		john deere	200clc	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,400.00	no	no
142	Rancourt & Son Land Clearing	commercial whole tree chipper w/loader		trelan	211	\$312.50	\$2,500.00	\$12,500.00	\$40,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$2,500.00	no	no
143	Rancourt & Son Land Clearing	grapple skidder		john deere	648giii	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$20,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,200.00	no	no
144	Rancourt & Son Land Clearing	feller buncher		morbark	6300	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$20,000.00	yes	yes	no	\$1,200.00	no	no
145	Thomas Gleason		500 gallons	liquid road sprayer	ud1800	\$160.00	\$1,280.00	\$6,400.00	n/a	yes	yes	no	\$750.00	\$140.00/hr	\$140.00/hr
146	Van Etten Contracting			komatsu	d-51	\$170.00	\$1,360.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,360.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
147	Van Etten Contracting			kubota	kx080	\$160.00	\$1,280.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,280.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
148	Van Etten Contracting			bobcat	337	\$150.00	\$1,200.00			yes	yes	no	\$1,200.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
149	Van Etten Contracting			falcon - add 150 for tow vehicle	6tn hot box	\$250.00	\$2,000.00			yes	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
150	Westchester Tractor	trommel screener	4	vibroscreen	scm115	n/a		\$3,000.00	\$9,000.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
151	Westchester Tractor	dirt roller		bomag	bw211	n/a	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	\$5,400.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
152	Westchester Tractor	18+" chipper		bandit	19xpc	n/a	\$500.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
153	Westchester Tractor	large wheel loader	3.5	hitachi	zw180	n/a	\$665.00	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
154	Westchester Tractor	large wheel loader	2.8	hitachi	zw150	n/a	\$555.00	\$1,665.00	\$5,000.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
155	Westchester Tractor	skid steer	1	new holland	l234	n/a	\$245.00	\$735.00	\$2,200.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
156	Westchester Tractor	track skid steer	1	new holland	c234	n/a	\$335.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
157	Westchester Tractor	mini excavator		kubota	kx040	n/a	\$275.00	\$835.00	\$2,500.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
158	Westchester Tractor	midi excavator		kubota	kx080	n/a	\$370.00	\$1,100.00	\$3,300.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a
159	Westchester Tractor	sp stump grinder		bandit	2650	n/a	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	\$5,400.00	no	no	no	no	n/a	n/a