

County of Dutchess
RFB-DCP-26-20
Natural and Processed Sands and Gravels, Crushed Stone Aggregate, Run of Bank Gravel
Term: August 1, 2020 to July 31, 2021
EXTENDED THROUGH 07/31/23

Vendors:			<i>A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.</i>			<i>Elizaville Sand & Gravel, Inc.</i>			<i>Peckham Materials Corp.</i>			<i>Recycling Crushing Technology, Inc.</i>			<i>Red Wing Properties, Inc.</i>			<i>Red Wing Properties, Inc.</i>		
Location:			Hudson, NY			Elizaville, NY			Pleasant Valley, NY			Zone-L-27, Commerce Street			801 Spring Lake Road Milan, NY			2332 Route 82 Lagrangeville, NY		
Items	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.		
Item D-400: Subbase	ton	\$9.75	3000 lbs	cu yd	\$16.00	3200 lbs	ton	\$15.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$13.00	2700 lbs	ton	\$23.00	2700 lbs		
Item D-400R: Recycled Subbase Material	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			ton	\$12.50	3000 lbs	ton	\$12.00		No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-401: Mortar (Mason) Sand	ton	\$12.00	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$30.00	2400 lbs	ton	\$40.00	2400 lbs		
Item D-402: Screened Gravel ¼"	ton	\$10.25	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-403: Screened Gravel ½"	ton	\$10.25	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$13.00	2400 lbs					
Item D-404: Screened Gravel 1"	ton	\$10.25	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$13.00	2400 lbs					
Item D-405: Screened Gravel 1 ½"	ton	\$10.25	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$13.00	2400 lbs					
Item D-406: Screenings	ton	\$9.00	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-407: Cobble Stones	ton	\$10.25	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-408: Screened Topsoil	NB		NB	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$25.00	2400 lbs	ton	\$30.00	2400 lbs		
Item D-410X: Crushed Stone ¼" Nom.	ton	\$12.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$16.90	2450 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-411X: Crushed Stone 3/8" Nom.	ton	\$12.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$16.90	2500 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-412: Crushed Stone ½" Nom.	ton	\$12.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$16.90	2500 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Vendors:			<i>A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.</i>			<i>Elizaville Sand & Gravel, Inc.</i>			<i>Peckham Materials Corp.</i>			<i>Recycling Crushing Technology, Inc.</i>			<i>Red Wing Properties, Inc.</i>			<i>Red Wing Properties, Inc.</i>		
Location:			Hudson, NY			Elizaville, NY			Pleasant Valley, NY			Zone-L-27, Commerce Street			801 Spring Lake Road Milan, NY			2332 Route 82 Lagrangeville, NY		
Items	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.		
Item D-413: Crushed Stone ¾" Nom.	ton	\$11.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$16.90	2600 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-414: Crushed Stone 1" Nom.	ton	\$11.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-415: Crushed Stone 1 ½" Nom.	ton	\$11.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$19.00	2750 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-416: Crushed Stone 2" Nom.	No Bid		NB	No Bid			ton	\$19.00	2750 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-418: Grout Sand	No Bid		NB	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-419: Concrete Sand	ton	\$12.00	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$16.00	2400 lbs	ton	\$25.00	2400 lbs		
Item D-420: Stone Filling, Fine	ton	\$11.50	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$20.00	2800 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-421: Stone Filling, Light	ton	\$11.75	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$20.00	2800 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-422: Stone Filling, Medium	ton	\$15.00	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$21.25	3000 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-423: Stone Filling, Heavy	ton	\$15.00	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$22.00	3200 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-424: Bedding Material	ton	\$13.00	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$19.00	2700 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				
Item D-425: Cushion Sand	ton	\$12.00	3000 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$18.00	2900 lbs	No Bid			ton	\$12.00	2400 lbs	ton	\$20.00	2400 lbs		
Item D-1400: Run of Bank Gravel	No Bid			cu yd	\$12.00	2800 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				

See RFB-DCP-26-20 specifications for detailed terms and conditions.

County of Dutchess
RFB-DCP-26-20
Natural and Processed Sands and Gravels, Crushed Stone Aggregate, Run of Bank Gravel
Term: August 1, 2020 to July 31, 2021
EXTENDED THROUGH 07/31/23

Vendors:		<i>Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.</i>			<i>Scott Excavating</i>			<i>Thalle Industries, Inc.</i>			<i>Tilcon NY, Inc.</i>			<i>Wingdale Materials, LLC</i>		
Location:		Zone WS-17, Canoe Hill Road			Unionvale, NY			172 Route 9 Fishkill, NY			Clinton Point Quarry 461 Sheafe Road Wappingers Falls, NY			3206 Pleasant Ridge Road Wingdale, NY		
Items	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	
Item D-400: Subbase	ton	\$16.00		cu yd	\$15.00	2950 lbs	ton	\$15.00		US ton	\$14.00		ton	\$13.50		
Item D-400R: Recycled Subbase Material	No Bid			No Bid			asphalt-sub base ton	\$10.00		No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-401: Mortar (Mason) Sand	ton	\$30.00		cu yd	\$15.00	2400 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-402: Screened Gravel ¼"	ton	\$16.00		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-403: Screened Gravel ½"	ton	\$17.75		cu yd	\$16.00	2700 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-404: Screened Gravel 1"	ton	\$18.25		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-405: Screened Gravel 1 ½"	ton	\$18.25		cu yd	\$15.00	2850 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-406: Screenings	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$15.00		US ton	\$16.00		No Bid			
Item D-407: Cobble Stones	No Bid			cu yd	\$15.00	2750 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-408: Screened Topsoil	No Bid			cu yd	\$25.00	2300 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-410X: Crushed Stone ¼" Nom.	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$23.00		No Bid			ton	\$21.00	2450 lbs	
Item D-411X: Crushed Stone 3/8" Nom.	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$23.00		No Bid			ton	\$20.75	2500 lbs	
Item D-412: Crushed Stone ½" Nom.	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$22.00		US ton	\$18.00		ton	\$18.50	2500 lbs	
Vendors:		<i>Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.</i>			<i>Scott Excavating</i>			<i>Thalle Industries, Inc.</i>			<i>Tilcon NY, Inc.</i>			<i>Wingdale Materials, LLC</i>		
Location:		Zone WS-17, Canoe Hill Road			Unionvale, NY			172 Route 9 Fishkill, NY			Clinton Point Quarry 461 Sheafe Road Wappingers Falls, NY			3206 Pleasant Ridge Road Wingdale, NY		
Items	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Weight of Cu. Yd.	
Item D-413: Crushed Stone ¾" Nom.	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$19.50		US ton	\$18.00		ton	\$18.50	2600 lbs	
Item D-414: Crushed Stone 1" Nom.	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$19.50		US ton	\$18.00		No Bid			
Item D-415: Crushed Stone 1 ½" Nom.	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$22.00		US ton	\$18.00		ton	\$18.50	2700 lbs	
Item D-416: Crushed Stone 2" Nom.	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$22.00		US ton	\$18.00		ton	\$20.00	2700 lbs	
Item D-418: Grout Sand	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-419: Concrete Sand	ton	\$18.00		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Item D-420: Stone Filling, Fine	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$23.00		US ton	\$20.00		ton	\$20.50	2800 lbs	
Item D-421: Stone Filling, Light	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$23.00		US ton	\$21.00		ton	\$20.50	2800 lbs	
Item D-422: Stone Filling, Medium	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$35.00		US ton	\$23.00		ton	\$20.50	3000 lbs	
Item D-423: Stone Filling, Heavy	No Bid			No Bid			ton	\$50.00		US ton	\$28.50		ton	\$26.75	3200 lbs	

Item D-424: Bedding Material	No Bid		cu yd	\$15.00	2400 lbs	ton	\$22.00		US ton	\$18.00		ton	\$20.00	2700 lbs
Item D-425: Cushion Sand	No Bid		cu yd	\$15.00	2400 lbs	ton	\$15.00		US ton	\$16.00		ton	\$20.50	2900 lbs
Item D-1400: Run of Bank Gravel	ton	\$19.00	cu yd	\$12.50	2800 lbs	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
See RFB-DCP-26-20 specifications for detailed terms and conditions.														