RFB-DCP-26-20

Natural & Processed Sands & Gravel, Crushed Stone Aggregate, Run of Bank Gravel
AWARDED VENDOR LIST (See attached price list.)
Term: August 1, 2020 to July 31, 2021, with two (2) twelve (12) month renewal options

J.R. Heffner

A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.

91 Newman Road (physical address)
P.O. Box 302 (mailing address)
Hudson, NY 12534

518-828-3218

jrh@acolarusso.com

Steve Williams

Elizaville Sand & Gravel, Inc.

624 Pleasantvale Road (physical address)
P.O. Box 151 (mailing address)
Elizaville, NY 12523

845-756-2447

d_williams38@live.com

Kevin McCarthy

Peckham Materials Corp.

410 North Avenue (physical address)
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569

172 Prospect Hill Road (mailing address)
Brewster, NY 10509

914-949-2000

kmcca@peckham.com

Stewart D. Petrovits

Recycling Crushing Technology, Inc.
27 Commerce Street

Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-471-8700
stewart@btm.construction

Frank J. Doherty Jr.

Red Wing Properties, Inc.

675 Leetown Road (physical address)
P.O. Box 408 (mailing address)
Stormville, NY 12582

845-221-2224

fidjr7 @redwingsandandgravel.com

Dana L. Wiehe

Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.

17 Canoe Hill Road (physical address)
Millbrook, NY 12545

27 Commerce Street (mailing address)
Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-266-3433
route82sand@verizon.net

Tanna Jones Kiniry

Scott Excavating

780 North Clove Road (physical address)
Millbrook, NY 12545

147 Mallory Road (mailing address)
Verbank, NY 12585

845-677-5705

845-489-1750

tmja@usa.net

Mike Keahon

Thalle Industries, Inc.

172 Route 9 (physical address)
Fishkill, NY 12524

51 Route 100 (mailing address)
Briarcliff Manor, NY 10510
845-896-5156

914-291-3689 (cell)
mkeahon@thalleindustries.com

Sean T. O’Sullivan
Tilcon New York Inc.
9 Entin Road
Parsippany, NJ 07054
973-366-7741
dcmoore@tilconny.com

Kevin McCarthy

Wingdale Materials LLC

3206 Pleasant Ridge Road (physical address)
Wingdale, NY 12594

172 Prospect Hill Road (mailing address)
Brewster, NY 10509

914-949-2000

kmcca@peckham.com
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County of Dutchess

Contract #: RFB-DCP-26-20
Title: Natural & Processed Sands & Gravels Crushed Stone Aggregate, Run of Bank Gravel

Term: August 1, 2020 to July 31, 2021,
the contract or unit portion let and awarded by the County, may be extended by mutual agreement of the parties for
two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms, with the same terms, conditions and pricing as the original Contract.

Vendors: A. Colarusso & Son, Elizaville Sand & Peckham Materials Recycling Crushing Red Wing Properties, Red Wing Properties,
Inc. Gravel, Inc. Corp. Technology, Inc. Inc. Inc.
Location: Hudson, NY Elizaville, NY Pleasant Valley, NY Zone-L-Z,re(;)mmerce 801 S&::Zg'ﬁlﬁe Rd, La;ﬁégﬁg?;\w
Weight Weight Weight Weight Weight
Unitof | Unit | of Cu [ unitof | Unit | of Cu || unitof Unit of Cu [ unitof | Unit | of Cu || unitof Unit  [Weight of|| unit of Unit of Cu
ltems Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Cu Yd || Measure | Price Yd

Item D-400: Subbase ton $9.75 (3000 Ibgl| cuyd |$16.00 |3200 Ibs|[ ton $15.50 |3000 Ibsl| No Bid ton | $13.00 [ 2700 Ibs| ton $23.00 |2700 Ibs

Item D-400R:

Recycled Subbase Material No Bid NB No Bid ton $12.50 (3000 Ibg| ton |$12.00 No Bid No Bid

Item D-401: Mortar (Mason) Sand ton |$12.00 |3000 Ibs|{ No Bid No Bid No Bid ton $30.00 | 2400 Ibs ton $40.00 2400 Ibs

Item D-402: Screened Gravel ¥4 ton |$10.25 |3000 Ibs|{ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item D-403: Screened Gravel ¥%2” ton |$10.25 |3000 Ibsl{ No Bid No Bid No Bid ton $13.00 | 2400 Ibs

Item D-404: Screened Gravel 1” ton |$10.25 |3000 Ibsl{ No Bid No Bid No Bid ton $13.00 | 2400 Ibs

Item D-405: Screened Gravel 1 %” ton |$10.25 |3000 Ibsl{ No Bid No Bid No Bid ton $13.00 | 2400 Ibs

Item D-406: Screenings ton $9.00 [3000 Ibg| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item D-407: Cobble Stones ton |$10.25 |3000 Ibsl| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item D-408: Screened Topsoil NB NB || No Bid No Bid No Bid ton | $25.00 | 2400 Ibs|f ton | $30.00 |2400 lbs

Item D-410X: Crushed Stone %" Nom. ton [$12.50 |3000 Ibsf No Bid ton | $16.90 |2450 Ibg| No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item D-411X: Crushed Stone 3/8” Nom. ton [$12.50 {3000 Ibs" No Bid ton | $16.90 (2500 Ibs[| No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item D-412: Crushed Stone %2” Nom. ton [$12.50 {3000 Ibs" No Bid ton | $16.90 (2500 Ibg| No Bid No Bid No Bid
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A. Colarusso & Son,

Elizaville Sand &

Peckham Materials

Recycling Crushing

Red Wing Properties,

Red Wing Properties,

Vendors: Inc. Gravel, Inc. Corp. Technology, Inc. Inc. Inc.
Location: Hudson, NY Elizaville, NY Pleasant Valley, NY Zone-L-Z,re(éf[)mmerce 801 S&::Zg'ﬁlﬁe Rd, Laszlizg]e?\;[ﬁli,z;\w
Weight Weight Weight Weight Weight
Unitof | Unit | of Cu [ unitof | Unit | of Cu || unitof Unit of Cu || wnitof | Unit | of Cu || unitof Unit  [Weight of|| unit of Unit of Cu
ltems Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Cu Yd || Measure | Price Yd
Item D-413: Crushed Stone % ” Nom. ton |$11.50 |3000 Ibs|{ No Bid ton $16.90 |2600 Ibs| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-414: Crushed Stone 1” Nom. ton |$11.50 |3000 Ibs|{ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-415: Crushed Stone 1 % ” Nom. ton |$11.50 |3000 Ibsl{ No Bid ton $19.00 |2750 Ibs| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-416: Crushed Stone 2” Nom. No Bid NB No Bid ton $19.00 |2750 Ibsl[ No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-418: Grout Sand No Bid NB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-419: Concrete Sand ton |$12.00 |3000 Ibsl| No Bid No Bid No Bid ton $16.00 | 2400 Ibs ton $25.00 12400 Ibs
Item D-420: Stone Filling, Fine ton [$11.50 |3000 Ibsf No Bid ton | $20.00 |2800 Ibg| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-421: Stone Filling, Light ton |$11.75 |3000 Ibs" No Bid ton | $20.00 |2800 Ibg| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-422: Stone Filling, Medium ton |$15.00 |3000 Ibs" No Bid ton | $21.25 |3000 Ibg| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-423: Stone Filling, Heavy ton |$15.00 |3000 Ibs" No Bid ton | $22.00 |3200 Ibgl[ No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-424: Bedding Material ton [$13.00 {3000 Ibsl No Bid ton | $19.00 |2700 Ibgl[ No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-425: Cushion Sand ton |$12.00 (3000 Ibg| No Bid ton | $18.00 |2900 Ibg[ No Bid ton | $12.00 | 2400 Ibs|| ton | $20.00 |2400 Ibs
Item D-1400: Run of Bank Gravel No Bid cuyd |$12.00 |2800 Ibs| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

See RFB-DCP-26-20 specifications for detailed terms and conditions.
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County of Dutchess

Contract #: RFB-DCP-26-20
Title: Natural & Processed Sands & Gravels Crushed Stone Aggregate, Run of Bank Gravel

Term: August 1, 2020 to July 31, 2021,
the contract or unit portion let and awarded by the County, may be extended by mutual agreement of the parties for
two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms, with the same terms, conditions and pricing as the original Contract.

Route 82 Sand &

Wingdale Materials

: Scott Excavatin Thalle Industries, Inc. Tilcon NY, Inc.
Vendors: Gravel, Inc. g LLC
. Clinton Point Quarry Wingdale Materials
. Zone WS-17, Canoe Hill . S .
Location: Road Unionvale, NY 172 Rte 9, Fishkill, NY 461 Sheafe Road, 3206 Pleasant Ridge
Wappingers Falls, NY Road, Wingdale, NY
Weight Weight Weight Weight
Unit of Unit  |Weight of [ ynit of Unit of Cu Unit of Unit of Cu Unit of Unit of Cu Unit of Unit of Cu
ltems Measure | Price Cu Yd || Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd
Item D-400: Subbase ton | $16.00 cuyd | $15.00 |2950 Ibsf[ ton $15.00 US ton | $14.00 ton $13.50
asphalt sub
Item D-400R: base
Recycled Subbase Material No Bid No Bid ton | $10.00 No Bid No Bid
Item D-401: Mortar (Mason) Sand ton $30.00 cuyd | $15.00 (2400 Ibs| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-402: Screened Gravel ¥4” ton $16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-403: Screened Gravel ¥%2” ton $17.75 cuyd | $16.00 (2700 Ibs| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-404: Screened Gravel 1” ton $18.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-405: Screened Gravel 1 %" ton $18.25 cuyd | $15.00 (2850 Ibs| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-406: Screenings No Bid No Bid ton $15.00 US ton | $16.00 No Bid
Item D-407: Cobble Stones No Bid cuyd | $15.00 |2750 Ibs|| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-408: Screened Topsoil No Bid cuyd | $25.00 12300 Ibs|| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-410X: Crushed Stone %” Nom. No Bid No Bid ton $23.00 No Bid ton $21.00 (2450 Ibg
Item D-411X: Crushed Stone 3/8” Nom. No Bid No Bid ton $23.00 No Bid ton $20.75 [2500 Ibs
Item D-412: Crushed Stone %" Nom. No Bid No Bid ton $22.00 US ton | $18.00 ton $18.50 |2500 Ibs
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Route 82 Sand & Gravel,

Wingdale Materials

Vendors: Inc Scott Excavating Thalle Industries, Inc. Tilcon NY, Inc. LLC
. Clinton Point Quarry Wingdale Materials
. Zone WS-17, Canoe Hill . S .
Location: Road Unionvale, NY 172 Rte 9, Fishkill, NY 461 Sheafe Road, 3206 Pleasant Ridge
Wappingers Falls, NY Road, Wingdale, NY
Weight Weight Weight Weight
Unit of Unit  |Weight of [ ynit of Unit of Cu Unit of Unit of Cu Unit of Unit of Cu Unit of Unit of Cu
ltems Measure | Price Cu Yd || Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd Measure | Price Yd
Item D-413: Crushed Stone % ” Nom. No Bid No Bid ton $19.50 US ton | $18.00 ton $18.50 (2600 Ibg|
Item D-414: Crushed Stone 1” Nom. No Bid No Bid ton $19.50 US ton | $18.00 No Bid
Item D-415: Crushed Stone 1% ” Nom. No Bid No Bid ton $22.00 US ton | $18.00 ton $18.50 (2700 Ibg|
Item D-416: Crushed Stone 2” Nom. No Bid No Bid ton $22.00 US ton | $18.00 ton $20.00 (2700 Ibg|
Item D-418: Grout Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-419: Concrete Sand ton $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item D-420: Stone Filling, Fine No Bid No Bid ton | $23.00 US ton | $20.00 ton | $20.50 |2800 Ibg
Item D-421: Stone Filling, Light No Bid No Bid ton $23.00 US ton | $21.00 ton $20.50 (2800 Ibg|
Item D-422: Stone Filling, Medium No Bid No Bid ton [ $35.00 US ton | $23.00 ton [ $20.50 |3000 Ibs"
Item D-423: Stone Filling, Heavy No Bid No Bid ton [ $50.00 US ton | $28.50 ton [ $26.75 |3200 Ibs"
Item D-424: Bedding Material No Bid cuyd | $15.00 [24001bg| ton | $22.00 USton | $18.00 ton | $20.00 |2700 Ibg
Item D-425: Cushion Sand No Bid cuyd | $15.00 [24001Ibg| ton | $15.00 US ton | $16.00 ton | $20.50 |2900 Ibs
Item D-1400: Run of Bank Gravel ton | $19.00 cuyd | $12.50 (2800 Ibs| No Bid No Bid No Bid

See RFB-DCP-26-20 specifications for detailed terms and conditions.
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