

COUNTY OF DUTCHESS

RFB-DCP-28-22

New Storm Drainage and Culvert Pipe Accessory Fittings and Hardware

TERM: May 1, 2022 through April 30, 2023 with two (2) one (1) year renewal options

EXTENDED THROUGH 04/30/25

	PRIMARY AWARD	SECONDARY AWARD	TERTIARY AWARD	QUATERNARY AWARD
AWARDED VENDORS:	Chemung Supply Corporation 2420 Corning Road Elmira, NY 14903 Contact: Carl H. Perine 607-733-5506 cperine@chemungsupply.com	Expanded Supply Products, Inc. 3330 Route 9 Cold Spring, NY 10516 Contact: Charlie Kehr 845-265-3371 espinvoice@gmail.com	Carmel Winwater Works P.O. Box 550 Carmel, NY 10512 Contact: Michael Cesare 845-228-4086 mpcesare@winsupplyinc.com	Lane Enterprises, LLC 825 Route 67 Ballston Spa, NY 12020 Contact: Craig Shearer 518-885-4385 ebennett@lane-enterprises.com
% DISCOUNT FROM RETAIL PRICING:	NET		NET	10%
Smooth Interior Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe (SICPP)				
INSIDE DIAMETER	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT
10"	\$8.99	\$8.99	\$8.99	\$9.84
10" PERF	\$8.99	\$9.39	\$9.39	\$9.84
12"	\$9.29	\$9.29	\$9.29	\$10.94
12" PERF	\$9.29	\$9.70	\$9.70	\$10.94
15"	\$12.66	\$12.66	\$12.66	\$14.75
15" PERF	\$12.66	\$13.27	\$13.27	\$14.75
18"	\$17.46	\$17.46	\$17.46	\$20.17
18" PERF	\$17.46	\$18.33	\$18.33	\$20.17
21"	not available	not available	no bid	no bid
21" PERF	not available	not available	no bid	no bid
24"	\$30.43	\$30.43	\$30.43	\$31.64
24" PERF	\$30.43	\$31.93	\$31.91	\$31.64
30"	\$41.76	\$41.76	\$41.76	\$49.40
30" PERF	\$41.76	\$43.81	\$43.81	\$49.40
36"	\$53.20	\$53.20	\$53.20	\$63.77
36" PERF	\$53.20	\$55.86	\$55.86	\$63.77
42"	\$76.58	\$76.58	\$76.58	\$86.49
42" PERF	\$76.58	\$80.41	\$80.41	\$86.49
48"	\$93.03	\$98.03	\$98.03	\$112.87
48" PERF	\$93.03	\$102.93	\$102.93	\$112.87
60"	\$162.36	\$162.36	\$162.36	\$197.89
60" PERF	\$162.36	\$170.48	\$170.48	\$197.89
Perforated Corrugated Polyethylene Underdrain Tubing				
INSIDE DIAMETER	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT
4"	\$0.92	\$0.92	\$0.92	\$0.86
6"	\$2.04	\$2.04	\$2.04	\$2.26
8"	\$5.92	\$5.92	\$5.92	\$4.45

AWARDED VENDORS:	PRIMARY AWARD	SECONDARY AWARD	TERTIARY AWARD	QUATERNARY AWARD
	Chemung Supply Corporation 2420 Corning Road Elmira, NY 14903 Contact: Carl H. Perine 607-733-5506 cperine@chemungsupply.com	Expanded Supply Products, Inc. 3330 Route 9 Cold Spring, NY 10516 Contact: Charlie Kehr 845-265-3371 espinvoice@gmail.com	Carmel Winwater Works P.O. Box 550 Carmel, NY 10512 Contact: Michael Cesare 845-228-4086 mpcesare@winsupplyinc.com	Lane Enterprises, LLC 825 Route 67 Ballston Spa, NY 12020 Contact: Craig Shearer 518-885-4385 ebennett@lane-enterprises.com
Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III		NOT EXTENDED THROUGH 04/30/25		
INSIDE DIAMETER	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT
12"	\$17.00	\$17.00	\$29.95	no bid
18"	\$19.50	\$22.50	\$40.91	no bid
21"	\$24.00	not available	no bid	no bid
24"	\$28.00	\$38.50	\$64.75	no bid
30"	\$40.00	\$51.25	\$125.53	no bid
36"	\$55.00	\$67.75	\$137.16	no bid
48"	\$105.00	\$114.50	\$241.15	no bid
60"	\$175.00	\$201.50	\$335.95	no bid
Corrugated Steel Pipe		NOT EXTENDED THROUGH 04/30/25		
INSIDE DIAMETER	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT
12"	\$22.03	\$24.19	\$25.70	\$24.56
15"	\$24.00	\$29.85	\$32.03	\$30.55
18"	\$30.35	\$35.58	\$39.10	\$36.61
21"	\$39.46	not available	\$45.90	\$42.61
24"	\$43.57	\$47.00	\$53.32	\$48.70
30"	\$57.36	\$59.13	\$65.04	\$61.55
36"	\$74.06	\$71.21	\$78.54	\$74.34
Galvanized Steel End Sections		NOT EXTENDED THROUGH 04/30/25		
INSIDE DIAMETER	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT	UNIT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT
12"	\$141.70	\$127.94	\$117.50	\$82.05
15"	\$196.17	\$147.55	\$155.00	\$102.68
18"	\$225.23	\$177.51	\$207.50	\$134.22
21"	\$324.43	not available	\$280.00	\$164.85
24"	\$326.40	\$238.05	\$316.25	\$197.95
30"	\$687.10	\$475.53	\$647.50	\$445.82
36"	\$915.21	\$646.19	\$857.50	\$627.57
48"	\$1,910.98	\$2,173.90	\$1,758.75	\$2,235.68
60"	\$3,271.81	\$3,386.42	\$2,835.00	\$3,512.02
See RFB-DCP-28-22 specifications for detailed terms and conditions.				