

COUNTY OF DUTCHESS**RFB-DCP-44-26****Rental of Machinery and Equipment****TERM: June 1, 2026 - May 31, 2027 with three (3) one (1) year renewal options**

A. Colarusso & Son, Inc. 91 Newman Road Hudson, NY 12534 Contact: Michael Malchow 518-828-3218 mikem@acolarusso.com	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp. 141 Daley Road Poughkeepsie, NY 12603 Contact: Tom Craparo 845-454-3650 tommy@avelloasphalt.com	B&K Excavation, Inc. 261 Van Wagner Road Poughkeepsie, NY 12603 Contact: Dianne Harrand 845-206-6033 bandkexcavation@aol.com
Blacktop Maintenance Corporation 27 Commerce Street Poughkeepsie, NY 12603 Contact: Stew Petrovits 845-471-8700 stewart@btm.construction	Callanan Industries, Inc. 8 Southwood Boulevard, 4th floor Albany, NY 1221 Contact: Nick Duncan 518-374-2222 estimating@callanan.com	Clove Excavators, Inc. 212 Van Wagner Road Poughkeepsie, NY 12603 Contact: Lisa Vumbico 845-452-5030 lisa@cloveexcavators.com
Fred A. Cook, Jr., Inc. 3226 Albany Post Road Buchanan, NY 10511 Contact: Brian F. Cook 914-739-3300 bcook@fredcook.com	Herc Rentals, Inc. 3 Avis Drive Latham, NY 1211 Contact: Matt PRokesch 929-759-0851 hercbids@hercrentals.com	JESCO, Inc. 118 St. Nicholas Avenue South Plainfield, NJ 07080 Contact: Charles Dull 908-753-8080 governmentalsa@jesco.us
Peckham Road Corporation 438 Vaughn Road Hudson Falls, NY 12839 Contact: Caleb Edelstein 518-792-3157 cedel@peckham.com	Rancourt & Son Land Clearing Corporation 1438 Clove Valley Road Hopewell Junction, NY 12533 Contact: Rachel Rancourt 914-475-6683 rancourtlandclearing2@gmail.com	SUNCO, Inc. 597 Depot Hill Road Poughquag, NY 12570 Contact: Charles W. Scott 845-206-6285 chuck@suncoinc.com
See RFB-DCP-44-26 specifications for detailed terms and conditions.		

COUNTY OF DUTCHESS														
RFB-DCP-44-26														
Rental of Machinery and Equipment														
TERM: June 1, 2026 - May 31, 2027 with three (3) one (1) year renewal options														
ITEM #	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	CUBIC YARD CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 WEEK RATE	OPERATOR INCLUDED YES OR NO	HELPER INCLUDED YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	PICK-UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$
1	AIR COMPRESSOR	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		IR	185	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	no	no
1	AIR COMPRESSOR	Herc Rentals, Inc.		DOOSAN	C185WDO	\$168.00	\$168.00	\$362.00	\$835.00	no	no	\$84.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
2	AIR COMPRESSOR WITH JACK HAMMER	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		IR	185	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	no	no
2	AIR COMPRESSOR WITH JACK HAMMER	Herc Rentals, Inc.		DOOSAN/APT	C185WDO/M117	\$222.00	\$222.00	\$541.00	\$1,208.00	no	no	\$111.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
3	ASPHALT COLD MIX PAVER	Peckham Road Corporation		CAT	AP655F	\$785.00	\$6,280.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	\$6,280.00	\$1,600.00	no
4	ASPHALT CURB FORMING MACHINE							NO BIDS						
5	ASPHALT HOT CRACK SEALER	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		CRAFCO		\$500.00	\$4,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$80,000.00	yes	yes	\$4,000.00	no	no
6	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 2' TO 4'	A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.		WIRTGEN	2000	no bid	\$5,500.00	\$26,000.00	no bid	yes	yes	\$5,500.00	\$650.00	\$650.00
6	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 2' TO 4'	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		WIRTGEN	120	\$650.00	\$5,200.00	\$26,000.00	\$104,000.00	yes	no	\$5,200.00	\$1,800.00	no
6	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 2' TO 4'	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	PM312	\$495.00	\$3,960.00	\$19,800.00	\$79,200.00	yes	yes	\$3,960.00	\$300.00	no
6	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 2' TO 4'	JESCO, Inc.		WIRTGEN	W60	no bid	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$18,000.00	no	no	\$2,000.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
6	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 2' TO 4'	Peckham Road Corporation		WIRTGEN	120F	\$685.00	\$5,480.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	\$5,480.00	\$1,200.00	no
7	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 7'	A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.		WIRTGEN	210FI	no bid	\$5,800.00	\$27,500.00	no bid	yes	yes	\$5,800.00	\$650.00	\$650.00
7	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 7'	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		WIRTGEN	210/220	\$900.00	\$7,200.00	\$36,000.00	\$144,000.00	yes	yes	\$7,200.00	\$1,800.00	no
7	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 7'	Callanan Industries, Inc.		WIRTGEN	210i	\$900.00	\$7,000.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	\$7,000.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00
7	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 7'	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	PM622	\$812.50	\$6,500.00	\$32,500.00	\$130,000.00	yes	no	\$6,500.00	\$1,100.00	no
7	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 7'	JESCO, Inc.		WIRTGEN	W210	no bid	\$4,350.00	\$13,000.00	\$39,000.00	no	no	\$13,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
7	ASPHALT MILLING MACHINE 7'	Peckham Road Corporation		ROADTEC	RX700	\$985.00	\$7,880.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	\$7,880.00	\$1,600.00	no
8	ASPHALT OR CONCRETE SAW - SELF-POWERED	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		TARGET	20	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	no	no
8	ASPHALT OR CONCRETE SAW - SELF-POWERED	Herc Rentals, Inc.		HUSQVARNA	FS524	\$179.00	\$179.00	\$609.00	\$1,260.00	no	no	\$82.50	\$180.00	\$180.00
9	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.	8' - 15'	CAT	AP455	\$400.00	\$3,200.00	\$16,000.00	\$64,000.00	yes	no	\$3,200.00	\$800.00	no
9	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	AP1055	\$400.00	\$3,200.00	\$16,000.00	\$64,000.00	yes	no	\$3,200.00	\$300.00	no
9	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	Callanan Industries, Inc.		CAT	1055F	\$850.00	\$6,400.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	\$6,400.00	\$800.00	\$800.00
9	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		ROADTEC	RP195	\$430.00	\$3,440.00	\$17,200.00	\$68,800.00	yes	no	\$3,440.00	\$275.00	no
9	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		ROADTEC	RP175	\$410.00	\$3,280.00	\$16,400.00	\$65,600.00	yes	no	\$3,280.00	\$275.00	no
9	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	JESCO, Inc.		VOGELE	SUPER 1700	no bid	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$22,500.00	no	no	\$7,500.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
9	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	Peckham Road Corporation		CAT	AP655F	\$785.00	\$6,280.00	no bid	no bid	yes	yes	\$6,280.00	\$1,600.00	no
10	ASPHALT PUGMILL	Peckham Road Corporation		MIDLAND	T-4100	\$365.00	\$2,920.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,920.00	\$1,600.00	no
11	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 3-6 TON	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		HAMM	HD12	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$250.00	no
11	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 3-6 TON	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		HAMM	HD12	\$210.00	\$1,680.00	\$8,400.00	\$33,600.00	yes	no	\$1,680.00	\$300.00	no
11	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 3-6 TON	Callanan Industries, Inc.		HAMM	HD10C	\$400.00	\$2,875.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,875.00	\$800.00	\$800.00
11	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 3-6 TON	Clove Excavators, Inc.		HAMM	HD14	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	\$275.00	no
11	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 3-6 TON	Herc Rentals, Inc.		VOLVO	DD25	\$336.00	\$336.00	\$809.00	\$2,153.00	no	no	\$336.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
11	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 3-6 TON	JESCO, Inc.		HAMM	HD14	no bid	\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,600.00	no	no	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
11	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 3-6 TON	Peckham Road Corporation		HAMM	HD-12	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,800.00	\$775.00	no
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		IR	DD 90/118	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$250.00	no
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	CB44	\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$1,760.00	\$300.00	no
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	Callanan Industries, Inc.		HAMM	HD1110	\$400.00	\$2,875.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,875.00	\$800.00	\$800.00
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	CB10	\$212.50	\$1,700.00	\$8,500.00	\$34,000.00	yes	no	\$1,700.00	\$275.00	no
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	Clove Excavators, Inc.		HAMM	HD110	\$212.50	\$1,700.00	\$8,500.00	\$34,000.00	yes	no	\$1,700.00	\$275.00	no
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	Herc Rentals, Inc.		DYNAPAC	CC4200VI	\$840.00	\$840.00	\$2,357.00	\$4,961.00	no	no	\$840.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	JESCO, Inc.		HAMM	HD110	no bid	\$550.00	\$1,600.00	\$4,800.00	no	no	\$550.00	\$400.00	\$780.00
12	ASPHALT ROLLER VIBRATOR 8-12 TON	Peckham Road Corporation		HAMM	HD-120	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$1,600.00	no bid
13	BACKHOE LOADERS, OTHER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	426	\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$1,760.00	\$300.00	no
13	BACKHOE LOADERS, OTHER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CASE	580	\$180.00	\$1,440.00	\$7,200.00	\$28,800.00	yes	no	\$1,440.00	\$275.00	no
13	BACKHOE LOADERS, OTHER	Herc Rentals, Inc.		DEERE	310LEP	\$431.00	\$431.00	\$1,124.00	\$2,494.00	no	no	no	\$180.00	\$180.00
13	BACKHOE LOADERS, OTHER	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	320P	no bid	\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,600.00	no	no	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
14	BACKHOE LOADERS, SKID STEER	B & K Excavation, Inc.		KUBOTA		\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$800.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
14	BACKHOE LOADERS, SKID STEER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	2602D	\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$1,760.00	\$300.00	no
14	BACKHOE LOADERS, SKID STEER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	252B	\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$6,800.00	\$27,200.00	yes	no	\$1,360.00	\$275.00	no
15	CATCH BASIN CLEANER - TRUCK MOUNTED	Fred A. Cook, Jr., Inc.	12-15	VACTOR	2100	\$325.00	\$2,800.00	\$14,000.00	\$52,000.00	yes	no	no	no	no
16	CHIPPER BRUSH - WHEEL MOUNTED/TOW TYPE	Herc Rentals, Inc.		BANDIT	MODEL-12XPC	\$536.00	\$536.00	\$1,349.00	\$3,413.00	no	no	\$268.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
17	CRANE - TRUCK							NO BIDS						
18	CRANE - ALL TERRAIN							NO BIDS						
19	CRANE - BOOM TRUCK							NO BIDS						

ITEM #	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	CUBIC YARD CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 WEEK RATE	OPERATOR INCLUDED YES OR NO	HELPER INCLUDED YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	PICK-UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$
20	DOZER D-8 CLASS WITH RIPPER	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	1050P	no bid	\$1,600.00	\$4,700.00	\$14,000.00	no	no	\$4,700.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00
21	HAMMER AND COMPRESSOR - TRACK DRILL													
22	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR WITH SHEET POUNDER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	303.5	\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$1,760.00	\$300.00	no
23	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TIRE MOUNTED	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	315	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$300.00	no
23	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TIRE MOUNTED	Herc Rentals, Inc.	28,000 lb	VOLVO	EWRI30E	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00	\$3,150.00	\$8,925.00	no	no	\$1,050.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
23	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TIRE MOUNTED	JESCO, Inc.		HYDREMA	MX16	no bid	\$875.00	\$2,600.00	\$7,800.00	no	no	\$875.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
24	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TRACK MOUNTED	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	326	\$275.00	\$2,200.00	\$11,000.00	\$44,000.00	yes	no	\$2,200.00	\$300.00	no
24	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TRACK MOUNTED	Clove Excavators, Inc.		BOBCAT	E88	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	\$31,200.00	yes	no	\$1,560.00	\$275.00	no
24	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TRACK MOUNTED	Herc Rentals, Inc.	28,000 lb	VOLVO	EC140EL	\$840.00	\$840.00	\$2,116.00	\$5,513.00	no	no	\$840.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
24	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TRACK MOUNTED	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	200P	no bid	\$700.00	\$2,000.00	\$6,300.00	no	no	\$700.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
24	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TRACK MOUNTED	SUNCO, Inc.	40,000 lb	CATERPILLAR	315CL	\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$880.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$1,760.00	\$160/hour	\$160/hour
24	HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR TRACK MOUNTED	SUNCO, Inc.	62,000 lb	CATERPILLAR	325	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$160/hour	\$160/hour
25	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 12-24,000 LBS	Herc Rentals, Inc.		FRD	F9FSP-WR	\$431.00	\$431.00	\$1,171.00	\$2,620.00	no	no	\$215.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
25	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 12-24,000 LBS	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	85P	no bid	\$850.00	\$3,200.00	\$10,200.00	no	no	\$850.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
26	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 24-70,000 LBS	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	315	\$350.00	\$2,800.00	\$14,000.00	\$56,000.00	yes	no	\$2,800.00	\$300.00	no
26	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 24-70,000 LBS	Clove Excavators, Inc.	8,000 lb	KOMATSU	PC360	\$560.00	\$4,480.00	\$22,400.00	\$89,600.00	yes	no	\$4,480.00	\$500.00	no
26	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 24-70,000 LBS	Clove Excavators, Inc.	7,500 lb	KOMATSU	PC308	\$515.00	\$4,120.00	\$20,600.00	\$82,400.00	yes	no	\$4,120.00	\$500.00	no
26	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 24-70,000 LBS	Herc Rentals, Inc.		FRD	FX175QTV	\$751.00	\$751.00	\$2,137.00	\$4,631.00	no	no	\$375.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
26	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 24-70,000 LBS	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	245P	no bid	\$1,600.00	\$4,800.00	\$14,400.00	no	no	\$1,600.00	\$700.00	\$500.00
26	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER EXCAVATOR 24-70,000 LBS	SUNCO, Inc.	4,000 lb	CATERPILLAR	325	\$337.50	\$2,700.00	\$13,500.00	\$54,000.00	yes	no	\$2,700.00	\$160/hour	\$160/hour
27	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER - EXCAVATOR MOUNTED	Clove Excavators, Inc.	1,000 lb	BOBCAT	E88	\$330.00	\$2,640.00	\$10,560.00	\$42,240.00	yes	no	\$2,640.00	\$275.00	no
27	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER - EXCAVATOR MOUNTED	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	345P	no bid	\$2,200.00	\$6,500.00	\$19,500.00	no	no	\$2,200.00	\$700.00	\$700.00
28	HYDRAULIC ROCK BREAKER - BACKHOE/BOOM MOUNTED	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	310P	no bid	\$800.00	\$2,300.00	\$6,900.00	no	no	\$800.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
29	JET RODDER (CONDUIT CLEANER) - TRUCK MOUNTED	Fred A. Cook, Jr., Inc.	12-15	VACTOR	2100	\$325.00	\$2,600.00	\$12,000.00	\$48,000.00	yes	no	no	no	no
30	MESSAGE BOARD - SOLAR	Herc Rentals, Inc.		SOLAR TECH	SILENTMSGR	\$226.00	\$226.00	\$735.00	\$1,271.00	no	no	\$113.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
31	MESSAGE BOARD - VARIABLE													
32	MOWER BOOM - TRACTOR MOUNTED, HYDRAULIC MOUNTED													
33	MOWER DITCHBANK ROADSIDE - TRACTOR													
34	PORTABLE PUMPS 6"	B & K Excavation, Inc.					\$300.00	\$1,500.00	\$6,000.00	no	no	\$300.00	no	no
34	PORTABLE PUMPS 6"	Herc Rentals, Inc.		MULTIQUIP	MQ600HTB	\$309.00	\$309.00	\$887.00	\$2,284.00	no	no	\$309.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
35	PORTABLE PUMPS 8"	Herc Rentals, Inc.		MULTIQUIP	MQ800HTB	\$420.00	\$420.00	\$1,108.00	\$3,570.00	no	no	\$420.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
36	PORTABLE PUMPS 10"													
37	HOSE FOR THE ABOVE PUMP - 6" x 50'	Herc Rentals, Inc.		VARIOUS	VARIOUS	\$43.00	\$43.00	\$108.00	\$285.00	no	no	\$21.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
38	HOSE FOR THE ABOVE PUMP - 6" x 20'	Herc Rentals, Inc.		VARIOUS	VARIOUS	\$47.00	\$47.00	\$119.00	\$314.00	no	no	\$23.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
39	HOSE FOR THE ABOVE PUMP - 8" x 50'	Herc Rentals, Inc.		VARIOUS	VARIOUS	\$98.00	\$98.00	\$273.00	\$743.00	no	no	\$49.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
40	HOSE FOR THE ABOVE PUMP - 8" x 20'	Herc Rentals, Inc.		VARIOUS	VARIOUS	\$61.00	\$61.00	\$188.00	\$534.00	no	no	\$30.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
41	HOSE FOR THE ABOVE PUMP - 10" x 50'													
42	HOSE FOR THE ABOVE PUMP - 10" x 20'													
43	PUMP 6" - TRASH													
44	ROAD GRADER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	120	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$300.00	no
44	ROAD GRADER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	120	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$275.00	no
44	ROAD GRADER	Peckham Road Corporation		CAT	120M2	\$300.00	\$2,400.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,400.00	\$1,600.00	no
45	ROAD MAINTAINER													
46	ROAD WIDENER - SELF-POWERED/TOW TYPE	A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.		MIDLAND		no bid	\$3,800.00	\$19,000.00	no bid	yes	yes	\$3,800.00	\$650.00	\$650.00
46	ROAD WIDENER - SELF-POWERED/TOW TYPE	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		MIDLAND		\$275.00	\$2,200.00	\$11,000.00	\$44,000.00	yes	no	\$2,200.00	\$300.00	no
46	ROAD WIDENER - SELF-POWERED/TOW TYPE	Clove Excavators, Inc.		MIDLAND	960	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	no	\$2,000.00	\$275.00	no
46	ROAD WIDENER - SELF-POWERED/TOW TYPE	Peckham Road Corporation		MIDLAND	SP8	\$1,065.00	\$8,520.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$8,520.00	\$1,600.00	no
47	RUBBER TIRE FRONT END LOADER/CRAWLER TRUCK	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	930	\$275.00	\$2,200.00	\$11,000.00	\$44,000.00	yes	no	\$2,200.00	\$300.00	no
47	RUBBER TIRE FRONT END LOADER/CRAWLER TRUCK	Clove Excavators, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	544	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$275.00	no
47	RUBBER TIRE FRONT END LOADER/CRAWLER TRUCK	Clove Excavators, Inc.	1.25	CATERPILLAR	906	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	\$275.00	no
47	RUBBER TIRE FRONT END LOADER/CRAWLER TRUCK	Herc Rentals, Inc.	3 cy	VOLVO	L70	\$836.00	\$836.00	\$2,258.00	\$6,143.00	no	no	\$819.00	\$180.00	\$180.00

ITEM #	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	CUBIC YARD CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 WEEK RATE	OPERATOR INCLUDED YES OR NO	HELPER INCLUDED YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	PICK-UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$
47	RUBBER TIRE FRONT END LOADER/CRAWLER TRUCK	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	331P	no bid	\$325.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00	no	no	\$325.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
48	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		BOBCAT	S3630/650	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$250.00	no
48	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER	B & K Excavation, Inc.		KUBOTA		\$230.00	\$1,840.00	\$9,200.00	\$36,800.00	yes	no	\$920.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
48	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	262D	\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$2,200.00	\$300.00	no
48	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	272	\$230.00	\$1,840.00	\$9,200.00	\$36,800.00	yes	no	\$1,840.00	\$275.00	no
48	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER	Here Rentals, Inc.	14" PLANER	KUBOTA/BOBCAT	SSV75/M7019	\$767.00	\$767.00	\$2,132.00	\$4,426.00	no	no	\$567.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
48	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	330P	no bid	\$850.00	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	no	N	\$850.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
48	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER	Peckham Road Corporation		BOBCAT	S630	\$230.00	\$1,840.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,840.00	\$775.00	no
49	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER WITH BUCKET	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.		BOBCAT	S3630/650	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$250.00	no
49	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER WITH BUCKET	B & K Excavation, Inc.		KUBOTA		\$205.00	\$1,640.00	\$8,200.00	\$32,800.00	yes	no	\$820.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
49	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER WITH BUCKET	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	262D	\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$2,200.00	\$300.00	no
49	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER WITH BUCKET	Callanan Industries, Inc.		BOBCAT		\$400.00	\$2,875.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,875.00	\$725.00	\$725.00
49	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER WITH BUCKET	Here Rentals, Inc.	14" PLANER	KUBOTA/BOBCAT	SSV75/M7019	\$767.00	\$767.00	\$2,132.00	\$4,426.00	no	no	\$567.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
49	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER WITH BUCKET	JESCO, Inc.		JOHN DEERE	330P	no bid	\$850.00	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	no	no	\$850.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
49	SKIDSTEER LOADER WITH MILLER WITH BUCKET	Peckham Road Corporation		BOBCAT	S630	\$230.00	\$1,840.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,840.00	\$775.00	no
50	SOIL SCREENER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		KOHLBERG	KR10	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$275.00	no
51	STONE AGGREGATE SPREADER - SELF-POWERED	Peckham Road Corporation		ETNYRE	4WD	\$600.00	\$4,800.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$4,800.00	\$1,600.00	no
52	STUMP GRINDER WITH TOW VEHICLE	NO BIDS												
53	SWEeper BROOM TYPE	B & K Excavation, Inc.		KUBOTA		\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$800.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
53	SWEeper BROOM TYPE	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	930	\$275.00	\$2,200.00	\$11,000.00	\$44,000.00	yes	no	\$2,200.00	\$300.00	no
53	SWEeper BROOM TYPE	Clove Excavators, Inc.		ELGIN BROOMBAIRE	FL42H	\$290.00	\$2,320.00	\$11,600.00	\$46,400.00	yes	no	\$2,320.00	no	no
53	SWEeper BROOM TYPE	Here Rentals, Inc.		LAYMOR	SM300	\$362.00	\$362.00	\$903.00	\$2,153.00	no	no	\$362.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
53	SWEeper BROOM TYPE	Peckham Road Corporation		NEW HOLLAND	TN55	\$210.00	\$1,680.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,680.00	\$775.00	no
54	SWEeper POWER PAVEMENT - TRUCK MOUNTED	NO BIDS												
55	SWEeper VACUUM TYPE STREET	Here Rentals, Inc.		NITEHAWK	RAPTOR II	\$1,890.00	\$1,890.00	\$4,988.00	\$18,900.00	no	no	\$1,890.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
56	TRENCHER	Here Rentals, Inc.	35-49 hp	DITCHWITCH	RT45	\$457.00	\$457.00	\$1,134.00	\$2,515.00	no	no	\$228.52	\$180.00	\$180.00
57	TRUCK - 10 WHEEL DUMP	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.	17 tons	MACK	R	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	no	\$1,400.00	no	no
57	TRUCK - 10 WHEEL DUMP	Clove Excavators, Inc.	6 wheel			\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$6,800.00	\$27,200.00	yes	no	\$1,360.00	no	no
57	TRUCK - 10 WHEEL DUMP	Here Rentals, Inc.	12-14 cy	FREIGHTLINER	M2-106	\$777.00	\$777.00	\$2,573.00	\$5,787.00	no	no	\$777.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
58	TRUCK - 18+ WHEEL FLOWBOY TRACTOR/TRAILER	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.	32 tons	MACK AND FLOWBOY	ST-1000	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	no	\$2,000.00	no	no
58	TRUCK - 18+ WHEEL FLOWBOY TRACTOR/TRAILER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation	35 tons			\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	no	\$1,400.00	no	no
58	TRUCK - 18+ WHEEL FLOWBOY TRACTOR/TRAILER	Clove Excavators, Inc.	37 tons			\$260.00	\$2,080.00	\$10,400.00	\$41,600.00	yes	no	\$2,080.00	no	no
58	TRUCK - 18+ WHEEL FLOWBOY TRACTOR/TRAILER	Peckham Road Corporation		VARIOUS	VARIOUS	\$235.00	\$1,880.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,880.00	no	no
59	TRUCK - DUMP TRACTOR TRAILER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation	35 tons			\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	no	\$1,400.00	no	no
59	TRUCK - DUMP TRACTOR TRAILER	Clove Excavators, Inc.	30 tons			\$225.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	yes	no	\$1,800.00	no	no
60	TRUCK - FLAT BED TRACTOR TRAILER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation	50 tons			\$190.00	\$1,520.00	\$7,600.00	\$30,400.00	yes	no	\$1,520.00	no	no
60	TRUCK - FLAT BED TRACTOR TRAILER	Clove Excavators, Inc.	35 tons			\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$1,760.00	no	no
61	TRUCK - OTHER TRACTOR TRAILERS	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.	50 tons	MACK AND ROGERS	LOWBOY	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	yes	no	\$2,000.00	no	no
61	TRUCK - OTHER TRACTOR TRAILERS	B & K Excavation, Inc.	50 tons	CATERPILLAR		\$220.00	\$1,760.00	\$8,800.00	\$35,200.00	yes	no	\$880.00	no	no
62	TRUCK - TRI-AXLE DUMP	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.	24 tons	MACK	CH/GRANITE	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	no	no
62	TRUCK - TRI-AXLE DUMP	B & K Excavation, Inc.	22 tons	CATERPILLAR		\$210.00	\$1,680.00	\$8,400.00	\$33,600.00	yes	no	\$840.00	no	no
62	TRUCK - TRI-AXLE DUMP	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation	24 tons			\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	no	\$1,320.00	no	no
62	TRUCK - TRI-AXLE DUMP	Clove Excavators, Inc.	25 tons			\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	no	no
62	TRUCK - TRI-AXLE DUMP	Peckham Road Corporation		VARIOUS	VARIOUS	\$235.00	\$1,880.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,800.00	no	no
62	TRUCK - TRI-AXLE DUMP	SUNCO, Inc.	22 tons	PETERBILT	567	\$165.00	\$1,320.00	\$6,600.00	\$26,000.00	yes	no	\$1,320.00	no	no
63	TUB GRINDER	Rancourt and Son Land Clearing Corporation	HORIZONTAL	VERMEER	HG4000	\$375.00	\$3,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$50,000.00	yes	no	\$6,000.00	no	no
63	TUB GRINDER	SUNCO, Inc.	300 yd/hr	BANDIT	2680	\$375.00	\$3,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$60,000.00	yes	no	\$15,000.00	\$160/hour	\$160/hour
64	LABORER/SCREEDMAN	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.				\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	no	no	\$1,200.00	no	no
64	LABORER/SCREEDMAN	Peckham Road Corporation				\$135.00	\$1,080.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,080.00	\$1,600.00	no
65	LABOR RATES IF APPLICABLE	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.				\$140.00	\$1,120.00	\$5,600.00	\$22,400.00	no	no	\$1,200.00	no	no
65	LABOR RATES IF APPLICABLE	Peckham Road Corporation				\$130.00	\$1,040.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$1,040.00	no	no
65	LABOR RATES IF APPLICABLE	SUNCO, Inc.				\$155.00	\$1,240.00	\$6,200.00	\$24,800.00	no	no	\$2,480.00	no	no
66	40' BUCKET TRUCK rated for electric	Here Rentals, Inc.		FORD	F550	\$698.00	\$698.00	\$1,995.00	\$5,513.00	no	no	\$698.00	\$180.00	\$180.00

ITEM #	MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	CUBIC YARD CAPACITY	MAKE OF EQUIPMENT	MODEL OF EQUIPMENT	HOURLY RATE	DAILY RATE	WEEKLY RATE	4 WEEK RATE	OPERATOR INCLUDED YES OR NO	HELPER INCLUDED YES OR NO	MINIMUM RENTAL FEE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	DELIVERY CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$	PICK-UP CHARGE (IF ANY) NO OR \$
OTHER MACHINERY		OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY	OTHER MACHINERY
	ASPHALT PAVER RUBBER TIRE/SELF POWER	Avello Asphalt & Construction Corp.	10' - 16'	ROADTEC	RP-195	\$400.00	\$3,200.00	\$16,000.00	\$64,000.00	yes	no	\$3,200.00	\$800.00	no
	BULLDOZER	B & K Excavation, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	D3	\$235.00	\$1,880.00	\$9,400.00	\$37,600.00	yes	no	\$940.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	BULLDOZER	B & K Excavation, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	D5	\$235.00	\$1,880.00	\$9,400.00	\$37,600.00	yes	no	\$940.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	EXCAVATOR	B & K Excavation, Inc.	52,000	CATERPILLAR	325	\$275.00	\$2,200.00	\$11,000.00	\$44,000.00	yes	no	\$1,100.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	EXCAVATOR	B & K Excavation, Inc.		KUBOTA	KX80	\$235.00	\$1,880.00	\$9,400.00	\$37,600.00	yes	no	\$940.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	EXCAVATOR WITH HAMMER	B & K Excavation, Inc.	5,000 lb	CATERPILLAR	325	\$325.00	\$2,600.00	\$13,000.00	\$52,000.00	yes	no	\$1,300.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	EXCAVATOR WITH HAMMER	B & K Excavation, Inc.		KUBOTA	KX80	\$260.00	\$2,080.00	\$10,400.00	\$41,600.00	yes	no	\$1,040.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	LOADER	B & K Excavation, Inc.	3 yards	CATERPILLAR	5CT34A	\$230.00	\$1,840.00	\$9,200.00	\$36,800.00	yes	no	\$920.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	ROLLER	B & K Excavation, Inc.		INTENSUS		\$180.00	\$1,440.00	\$7,200.00	\$28,800.00	yes	no	\$720.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	ROLLER	B & K Excavation, Inc.	3-5 ton	BOMAG		\$180.00	\$1,440.00	\$7,200.00	\$28,800.00	yes	no	\$720.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
	ROLLER - REMOTE WALK BEHIND	B & K Excavation, Inc.		WACKER			\$300.00	\$1,500.00	\$6,000.00	yes	no	\$2,400.00	no	no
	TRUCK - 1 TON WITH PLOW	B & K Excavation, Inc.		FORD	F550	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	no	\$1,050.00	no	no
	TRUCK - 1 TON WITH TRAILER	B & K Excavation, Inc.		FORD	F550	\$175.00	\$1,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	yes	no	\$1,050.00	no	no
	TRUCK - 6 WHEEL DUMP	B & K Excavation, Inc.	4 yards	FORD	F550	\$165.00	\$1,320.00	\$6,600.00	\$26,400.00	yes	no	\$660.00	no	no
	TRUCK - SITE	B & K Excavation, Inc.		TEREX	27TA	\$230.00	\$1,840.00	\$9,200.00	\$36,800.00	yes	no	\$1,840.00	\$220.00	\$220.00
	BULLDOZER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	D5	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	yes	no	\$1,800.00	\$300.00	no
	ROLLER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		CAT	433	\$225.00	\$1,800.00	\$9,000.00	\$36,000.00	yes	no	\$1,800.00	\$300.00	no
	ROLLER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		BOMAG	190	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$8,000.00	\$32,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	no	no
	TRUCK - WATER	Blacktop Maintenance Corporation		FORD/ FREIGHTLINER		\$160.00	\$1,280.00	\$6,400.00	\$25,600.00	yes	no	\$1,280.00	no	no
	BULLDOZER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	D3K	\$215.00	\$1,720.00	\$8,600.00	\$34,400.00	yes	no	\$1,720.00	\$275.00	no
	BULLDOZER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	D3XL	\$260.00	\$2,080.00	\$10,400.00	\$41,600.00	yes	no	\$2,080.00	\$275.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	305E	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	\$275.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.		KOMATSU	PC308	\$325.00	\$2,600.00	\$13,000.00	\$52,000.00	yes	no	\$2,600.00	\$500.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.		KOMATSU	PC138	\$210.00	\$1,680.00	\$8,400.00	\$33,600.00	yes	no	\$1,680.00	\$275.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.		KOMATSU	PC360	\$390.00	\$3,120.00	\$15,600.00	\$62,400.00	yes	no	\$3,120.00	\$500.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.		BOBCAT	E26	\$165.00	\$1,320.00	\$6,600.00	\$26,400.00	yes	no	\$1,320.00	\$275.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.		BOBCAT	E60	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	\$275.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.	250 lb	BOBCAT	E26	\$230.00	\$1,840.00	\$9,200.00	\$36,800.00	yes	no	\$1,840.00	\$275.00	no
	EXCAVATOR	Clove Excavators, Inc.	500 lb	BOBCAT	E60	\$270.00	\$2,160.00	\$10,800.00	\$43,200.00	yes	no	\$2,160.00	\$275.00	no
	EXCAVATOR - VACUUM	Clove Excavators, Inc.		VERMEER	VACTRON	\$425.00	\$3,400.00	\$17,000.00	\$68,000.00	yes	no	\$3,400.00	no	no
	LIFT	Clove Excavators, Inc.		GENIE	4GN675	\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$850.00	\$3,400.00	yes	no	\$1,360.00	\$275.00	no
	LOADER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		JOHN DEERE		\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$925.00	\$3,700.00	yes	N	\$1,480.00	\$275.00	no
	SKIDSTEER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	257	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$7,400.00	\$29,600.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	\$275.00	no
	SKIDSTEER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	272D	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$1,000.00	\$4,000.00	yes	no	\$1,600.00	\$275.00	no
	SKIDSTEER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		CATERPILLAR	299	\$205.00	\$1,640.00	\$8,200.00	\$32,800.00	yes	no	\$1,640.00	\$275.00	no
	TRENCH ROLLER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		JCB	roller		\$450.00	\$2,250.00	\$9,000.00	yes	no	\$450.00	\$275.00	no
	TRUCK - WATER	Clove Excavators, Inc.		INTERNATIONAL	4300	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$925.00	\$3,700.00	yes	no	\$1,480.00	no	no
	VAN - PIPE/PAVING	Clove Excavators, Inc.		PIPE/PAVING			\$375.00	\$1,875.00	\$7,500.00	yes	no	\$375.00	no	no
	EXCAVATOR - HYDRO	Fred A. Cook, Jr., Inc.	12	RAM VAC	HX-12	\$350.00	\$2,900.00	\$14,500.00	\$58,000.00	yes	yes	no	no	no
	EXCAVATOR - VACUUM	Fred A. Cook, Jr., Inc.	12	RAM VAC	HX-12	\$350.00	\$2,900.00	\$14,500.00	\$58,000.00	yes	yes	no	no	no
	TRUCK - TV	Fred A. Cook, Jr., Inc.		ARIES		\$325.00	\$2,600.00	\$12,500.00	\$50,000.00	yes	yes	no	no	no
	LIGHT TOWER	Herc Rentals, Inc.		WACKER	G4EC03	\$168.00	\$1,680.00	\$425.00	\$919.00	no	no	\$698.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
	ROLLER - ASPHALT	Herc Rentals, Inc.		WACKER	RD12	\$231.00	\$2,310.00	\$656.00	\$1,680.00	no	no	\$231.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
	TRAILER - TILT	Herc Rentals, Inc.		FELLING	FT7	\$126.00	\$1,260.00	\$368.00	\$683.00	no	no	\$63.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
	TRAILER - TILT	Herc Rentals, Inc.		FELLING	FT12	\$142.00	\$1,420.00	\$420.00	\$830.00	no	no	\$71.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
	DISTRIBUTOR - TACK	Peckham Road Corporation		ENTYRE		\$370.00	\$2,960.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,960.00	no	no
	LOADER	Peckham Road Corporation		ATHEY	H131	\$275.00	\$2,200.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,200.00	\$1,600.00	no
	RECLAIMER	Peckham Road Corporation		CAT	RM350B	\$720.00	\$5,760.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$5,760.00	\$1,600.00	no
	ROLLER - PNEUMATIC	Peckham Road Corporation		ROSCOE	915RT	\$285.00	\$2,280.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,280.00	\$1,600.00	no
	TRAILER - CALCIUM	Peckham Road Corporation		ENTYRE		\$280.00	\$2,240.00	no bid	no bid	yes	no	\$2,240.00	\$775.00	no
	CHIPPER - WHOLE TREE WITH LOADER	Rancourt and Son Land Clearing Corporation		TRELAN	21L	\$312.50	\$2,500.00	\$12,500.00	\$50,000.00	yes	no	\$5,000.00	no	no
	EXCAVATOR WITH STUMP SHEAR	Rancourt and Son Land Clearing Corporation		CATERPILLAR	320GC	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	no	\$2,400.00	no	no
	EXCAVATOR WITH THUMB	Rancourt and Son Land Clearing Corporation		KOMATSU	200LC8	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	no	\$2,400.00	no	no
	FELLER BUNCHER - TRACK MOUNTED	Rancourt and Son Land Clearing Corporation		CATERPILLAR	501HD	\$275.00	\$2,200.00	\$11,000.00	\$44,000.00	yes	no	\$4,400.00	no	no
	GRAPPLE SKIDDER	Rancourt and Son Land Clearing Corporation		JOHN DEERE	648GIII	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	no	\$2,400.00	no	no
	HORIZONTAL TUB GRINDER - TRACK MOUNTED	Rancourt and Son Land Clearing Corporation		VERMEER	HG525TX	\$375.00	\$3,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$60,000.00	yes	no	\$6,000.00	no	no
	BULLDOZER	SUNCO, Inc.	17,000 lb	DEERE	450	\$195.00	\$1,560.00	\$7,800.00	\$31,200.00	yes	no	\$1,560.00	\$125/hour	\$125/hour
	EXCAVATOR WITH ROTATING GRAPPLE	SUNCO, Inc.	65,000 lb	CATERPILLAR	325	\$260.00	\$2,080.00	\$10,400.00	\$41,600.00	yes	no	\$2,080.00	\$160/hour	\$160/hour
	LOADER - WHEEL	SUNCO, Inc.	2 yd	CATERPILLAR	908M	\$170.00	\$1,360.00	\$6,800.00	\$27,200.00	yes	no	\$1,360.00	\$125/hour	\$125/hour
	TRUCK - 6 WHEEL DUMP	SUNCO, Inc.	10 yd	MACK	GU712	\$150.00	\$1,200.00	\$6,000.00	\$24,000.00	yes	no	\$1,200.00	no	no

See RFB-DCP-44-26 for detailed terms and conditions.