

COUNTY OF DUTCHESS

BID # RFB-DCP-59-22

BID TITLE: Replacement Parts for Dutchess County Public Transit Heavy-Duty Vehicles

TERM: January 1, 2023 through December 31, 2023

Bidder:		D&W Diesel, Inc. 1503 Clark Street Road Auburn, NY 13021 Contact: Susan Clickner (315) 253-2324 s.clickner@dwdiesel.com				IEH Auto Parts, LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts 901 North Lenola Road Moorestown, NJ 08057 Contact: Brian Evanoka (855) 214-9055 fleetparts@autoplusap.com				Muncie Reclamation & Supply dba Muncie Transit Supply 3720 South Makison Street Muncie, IN 47302 Contact: Becky Huff (765) 288-1971 bhuff@abc-companies.com				New York Bus Sales, LLC 7765 Lakeport Road Chittenango, NY 13037 Contact: Gari McQuade (315) 687-3920 gmcquad@newyorkbussales.com			
Lot No.	Description	Catalog(s) Name	Catalog Dates	Minimum Percent Discount Off Catalog Price	Maximum Percent Markup Over Cost	Catalog(s) Name	Catalog Dates	Minimum Percent Discount Off Catalog Price	Maximum Percent Markup Over Cost	Catalog(s) Name	Catalog Dates	Minimum Percent Discount Off Catalog Price	Maximum Percent Markup Over Cost	Catalog(s) Name	Catalog Dates	Minimum Percent Discount Off Catalog Price	Maximum Percent Markup Over Cost
1	Aftertreatment parts and accessories including DEF, DOC, tank, sensor and associated specialized hardware	D&W online catalog found at www.dwdiesel.com		0.00%		Dorman	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
2	Air conditioning, heating, ventilation parts and accessories and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				Four Seasons	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
3	Axles including suspension, springs, shocks, struts, air bags, spindles, king pins and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				Monroe	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
						Moog	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Meritor	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Euclid	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
4	Body panels, frames, trim, bumper, brackets and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				NO BID				ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
5	Brake parts, linings, drums, rotors, pads, calipers, hoses, valves and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				Meritor	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
						Webb	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Bendix CVS	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Velvac	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
6	Cooling system parts and accessories including radiator, heater core, hoses and associated specialized hardware	D&W online catalog found at www.dwdiesel.com		0.00%		Four Seasons	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
						APDI	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Gates	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Spectra	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
7	Electrical parts and accessories (not lighting) including switches, relays, solenoids and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				Standard	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
						Wilson	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Motormite	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
8	Engines and engine parts and accessories including ERG cooler, turbos, compressor, fitting tubing and associated specialized hardware	D&W online catalog found at www.dwdiesel.com		0.00%		Fel-Pro	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
						FP Diesel	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
						Scaled Power	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
9	Exhaust system parts and accessories and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				Walker	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
						Nickson	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%								
10	Fire suppression system parts and accessories and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				Kidde	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
11	Floors, matting and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				NO BID				ABC-Companies On-line Store	1/1/2023	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
12	Fuel system parts and accessories including injectors, tanks, pumps and associated specialized hardware	D&W online catalog found at www.dwdiesel.com		0.00%		Delphi	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store		0.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	
						Standard	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	Emco Wheaton Retail/List Price		0.00%					
13	Gauges, meters, switches, relays, potentiometer and associated specialized hardware	NO BID				Stewart-Warner	NYS-MFN-LVL-Q4-18	61.00%	25.00%	ABC-Companies online store	01/01/23	12.00%		New York Bus Sales, LLC list pricing		26.00%	

