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BROTHER
1 BRTDR360 DRUM/HL-2170W 1 $87.13 $87.13
2 BRTDR420 DRUM/MFC-7360N 2 $71.65 $143.30
3 BRTPC201 CART,RIBN,F/PPF1170/1270/1770(450PG) 4 $23.54 $94.16
4 BRTTN330 TONER,BLK/HL-2170W 1 $39.13 $39.13
5 BRTTN350 TONER,F/HL2040/2070-2.5K 4 $58.75 $235.00
6 BRTTN420 TONER/MFC-7360N 3 $30.64 $91.92
7 BRTTN450 TONER,BLK.F/H2240-2.6K 2 $46.76 $93.52
8 BRTTN460 TONER,F/ MFC8600,(6K) 1 $75.24 $75.24
9 BRTTN570 TONER/HL5140 2 $87.48 $174.96

10 BRTTN660 TONER/TN660 1 $46.76 $46.76
11 TOTAL LINE ITEM # 1 through # 10 $1,081.12
12 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
13 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
14 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
15 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off (Brother) toners not listed above 30.00%

CANON
16 CNM4546B001AA INKCART,CLI-226,BK 1 $13.59 $13.59
17 CNM4547B001AA INKCART,CLI-226,CN 2 $13.59 $27.18
18 CNM4548B001AA INKCART.CLI-226,MAG 2 $13.59 $27.18
19 CNM4549B001AA INKCART,CLI-226,YL 2 $13.59 $27.18
20 CNM5206B005 INKCART,PG240XL/CL241XL 1 $43.99 $43.99
21 CNM6513B001AA INKCART,CLI-251,BK 3 $10.39 $31.17
22 CNM6514B001AA INKCART,CLI-251,CN 3 $10.39 $31.17
23 CNM6515B001AA INKCART,CLI251,MAG 3 $10.39 $31.17
24 CNM6516B001AA INKCART,CLI251,YL 3 $10.39 $31.17
25 TOTAL LINE ITEM # 16  through # 24 $263.80
26 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
27 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
28 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
29 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off (Canon) toners not listed above 20.00%

County of Dutchess
Bid # RFB-DCP-10-20

Toner and Ink Cartridges
Term:  May 1, 2020 - April 30, 2021, with two (2) one (1) year renewal options

(See RFB-DCP-10-20 specifications for detailed terms and conditions)

W. B. Mason Co., Inc.
12 Jeanne Drive

Newburgh, NY 12550
Contact:  Jeff Nucifore

888-926-2766
jeff.nucifore@wbmason.com

AWARDED VENDOR:
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12 Jeanne Drive
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888-926-2766
jeff.nucifore@wbmason.com
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EPSON
30 EPST252120 INK,BLK/WF-3640 1 $17.07 $17.07
31 EPST252520 INK,CLR/WF-3640 1 $30.89 $30.89
32 EPST126120 INK,BLK,F/NX420-740PG 7 $16.91 $118.37
33 EPST126220 INKCART,DURABRITE,HC,CN 6 $15.71 $94.26
34 EPST126320 INKCART,DURABRITE,HC,MG 7 $15.71 $109.97
35 EPST126420 INKCART,DURABRITE,HC,YL 5 $15.71 $78.55
36 TOTAL ITEM LINE # 30 through # 35 $449.11
37 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
38 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
39 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
40 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off (Epson) toners not listed above 12.00%

HEWLETT PACKARD
41 HEW51645A INKCART F/600C PRTR,BK-830PG 7 $34.04 $238.28
42 HEWB6Y15A INKCART,HP771,775ML,MTBK 1 $226.38 $226.38
43 HEWB6Y16A INKCART/Z6200 1 $226.38 $226.38
44 HEWB6Y17A INKCART/Z6200 1 $226.38 $226.38
45 HEWB6Y18A INKCART,HP771,775 ML,YL 1 $226.38 $226.38
46 HEWB6Y19A INKCART/Z6200 1 $226.38 $226.38
47 HEWB6Y20A INKCART/Z6200 1 $226.38 $226.38
48 HEWB6Y21A INKCART/Z6200 1 $226.38 $226.38
49 HEWB6Y22A INKCART,HP771,775 ML,LGY 2 $226.38 $452.76
50 HEWC4127X PRINTHEAD/4050N 4 *NO BID *NO BID
51 HEWC4810A PRINTHEAD,BK,2200SE(#11)-16K 1 $35.83 $35.83
52 HEWC4811A PRINTHEAD,CY,2200(#11) 1 $35.83 $35.83
53 HEWC4812A PRINTHEAD,MAG,F/2200 (#11) 1 $35.83 $35.83
54 HEWC5054A PRINTHEAD,CLEANER,HP90,BK 1 $160.04 $160.04
55 HEWC5055A PRINTHEAD,CLEANER,HP90,CY 1 $160.04 $160.04
56 HEWC5056A PRINTHEAD,CLEANER,HP90,MA 1 $160.04 $160.04
57 HEWC5057A PRINTHEAD,CLEANER,HP90,YW 1 $160.04 $160.04
58 HEWC5058A BLK/4500PS 1 $153.05 $153.05
59 HEWC5059A BLK,775-ML/4500PS 1 $262.35 $262.35
60 HEWC5061A CN/4500PS 1 $170.53 $170.53
61 HEWC5063A MAG/4500PS 1 $170.53 $170.53
62 HEWC5065A YL/4500PS 1 $170.53 $170.53
63 HEWC6578DN INKCART,CLR,#78,F/DJ970C(450PG) 4 $35.89 $143.56
64 HEWC7115A TONER,.F/1200/1220 (2.5K) 1 *NO BID *NO BID
65 HEWC8061X TONER,CART,LJ4100/4150(10K)-DISC 3 *NO BID *NO BID
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66 HEWC8765WN INKCART #94 BLK-11MIL-450 2 $23.24 $46.48
67 HEWC8766WN INKCART,#95-7ML TRICLR-260 2 $27.19 $54.38
68 HEWC8767WN INKCART,#96 21MIL BLK-800PG 255 $32.29 $8,233.95
69 HEWC9363WN INKCART,#97 TRICLR 14ML-560PGS 6 $36.99 $221.94
70 HEWC9363WN INKCART,#97 TRICLR 14ML-560PGS 227 $36.99 $8,396.73
71 HEWC9384A PRINTHEAD,#72 BLK & YEL 1 $58.46 $58.46
72 HEWC9391AN INKCART,CYN-# 88XL(1,840) 1 $22.98 $22.98
73 HEWC9392AN INKCART,MAG.-#88XL(1,840) 1 $22.98 $22.98
74 HEWC9393AN INKCART,YEL-#88XL(1,840) 1 $22.98 $22.98
75 HEWC9396AN INKCART,BLK,#88XL(2,580) 1 $40.61 $40.61
76 HEWCB435A TONER,F,P1005/1006-1.5K 5 $40.77 $203.85
77 HEWCC364A TONER,F/P4014/P4015-10K 16 $103.57 $1,657.12
78 HEWCC644WN INKCART,60XL,COL-H.Y.(440PG) 1 $35.11 $35.11
79 HEWCE017A PRINTHEAD,HP771,MTBK/RD 1 $160.22 $160.22
80 HEWCE018A Z6200 1 $160.22 $160.22
81 HEWCE019A PRINTHEAD,HP771,LTMG/LTCY 1 $160.22 $160.22
82 HEWCE020A Z6200 1 $160.22 $160.22
83 HEWCE255A TONER,F/P3015,BK-6K 1 $87.89 $87.89
84 HEWCE278A TONER,F/P1606,BK-2.1K 5 $47.17 $235.85
85 HEWCE278A TONER,F/P1606,BK-2.1K 3 $47.17 $141.51
86 HEWCE278D TONER,CE278A,DUAL PACK 3 $84.68 $254.04
87 HEWCE285A TONER,F/HP P1102,BK-1.6K 12 $41.19 $494.28
88 HEWCE390X TONER/LJ600,M602 3 $172.98 $518.94
89 HEWCE410A TONER,BLK.F/305A-2.2K 6 $50.39 $302.34
90 HEWCE410X TONER,LJ305X BLK.-4K 2 $61.90 $123.80
91 HEWCE411A TONER,CYN.F/305A-2.6K 3 $71.78 $215.34
92 HEWCE412A TONER,YEL.F/305A-2.6K 2 $71.78 $143.56
93 HEWCE413A TONER,MAG.F/305A-2.6K 2 $71.78 $143.56
94 HEWCE505A TONER,F/P2035/2055-2.3K 17 $53.28 $905.76
95 HEWCE505D TONER,CE505, DUAL PACK,BK 6 $96.17 $577.02
96 HEWCE505X TONER,F/P2055-6.5K 3 $97.74 $293.22
97 HEWCF217A TONER,F/M102/103/130-1.6K 5 $36.92 $184.60
98 HEWCF219A TONER/HPLJ,M102W 2 $41.59 $83.18
99 HEWCF226A TONER,F/M402/426 (26A)-3.1K 41 $69.03 $2,830.23

100 HEWCF230A TONER,F/M203/227,30A-1.6K 4 $37.47 $149.88
101 HEWCF230X HP,LJ M203DW 3 $59.05 $177.15
102 HEWCF232A DRUM 1 $53.17 $53.17
103 HEWCF258A INKCART/M404 4 $57.73 $230.92
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104 HEWCF258X INKCART/M404 4 $120.92 $483.68
105 HEWCF280A TONER,F/M401/425-2.7K 25 $61.68 $1,542.00
106 HEWCF280X TONER,F/M401/425-6.9K 9 $106.19 $955.71
107 HEWCF280XD TONER, DUAL PACK F/M401 11 $191.19 $2,103.09
108 HEWCF281X TONER,F/M630/605 / 606-(81X)-25K 1 $169.98 $169.98
109 HEWCF283A TONER,F/M127-1.5K 2 $38.47 $76.94
110 HEWCF350A TONER,BLK.#130A-1.3K 5 $33.83 $169.15
111 HEWCF351A TONER,CYN.#130A -1K 2 $34.89 $69.78
112 HEWCF352A TONER,YEL.#130A-1K 2 $34.89 $69.78
113 HEWCF353A TONER,MAG.#130A-1K 3 $34.89 $104.67
114 HEWCF370AM TONER,LJ 305A,CMY 2 $193.73 $387.46
115 HEWCF410A TONER,BLK.410A F/M452/477-2.3K 19 $51.31 $974.89
116 HEWCF411A TONER,CYN.F/M452/477-2.3K,CF411A 13 $66.27 $861.51
117 HEWCF412A TONER,YEL.F/M452/477-2.3K,CF412A 12 $66.27 $795.24
118 HEWCF413A TONER,MAG.F/M452/477-2.3K,CF413A 10 $66.27 $662.70
119 HEWCF500A TONER,BLK/M254W 3 $35.98 $107.94
120 HEWCF501A TONER,CYN/M254W 1 $42.57 $42.57
121 HEWCF502A TONER,YEL/M254W 1 $42.57 $42.57
122 HEWCF503A TONER,MAG/M254W 1 $42.57 $42.57
123 HEWCH644A Z6200 1 $56.68 $56.68
124 HEWCN049AN INKCART,950 OFCJET,BK-1K 26 $18.98 $493.48
125 HEWCN050AN INKCART,951 OFCJET,CN-700PG 16 $13.66 $218.56
126 HEWCN051AN INKCART,951 OFCJET,MG-700PG 26 $13.66 $355.16
127 HEWCN052AN INKCART,951 OFCJET,YL-700PG 24 $13.66 $327.84
128 HEWCR314FN HP 8100 2 $41.39 $82.78
129 HEWF6U15AN INKCART,HP 952,,BK-1K 11 $19.58 $215.38
130 HEWL0S49AN INKCART,HP 952 CYN-700PG 15 $13.66 $204.90
131 HEWL0S52AN INKCART,HP  952 MAG-700PG 9 $13.66 $122.94
132 HEWL0S55AN INKCART,HP 952,YEL-700PG 9 $13.66 $122.94
133 HEWQ1339A HP,LJ 4300TN 2 *NO BID *NO BID
134 HEWQ2610A TONER F/LJ2300 (6K) 2 $101.98 $203.96
135 HEWQ2612A TONER,F/LJ 1012/3030(2K) 7 $46.86 $328.02
136 HEWQ2613A TONER,F/LJ1300 (2.5K) 1 *NO BID *NO BID
137 HEWQ2613X TONER,/LJ1300 HY (4K) 2 $74.98 $149.96
138 HEWQ5942A TONER,F/LJ4240/4250/4350-10K 1 $109.72 $109.72
139 HEWQ5942X TONER F/LJ4250/4350 -20K 5 $166.03 $830.15
140 HEWQ5949A TONER,F/LJ1160/1320-2.5K 49 $60.58 $2,968.42
141 HEWQ5949XD TONER,Q5949X DUAL PK -BLK 2 *NO BID *NO BID
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142 HEWQ5950A TONER,BLK,F/CLJ4700-11K 3 $130.82 $392.46
143 HEWQ5951A TONER,CYN .F/CLJ4700-10K 3 $185.98 $557.94
144 HEWQ5952A TONER,YEL,F/CLJ4700-10K 2 $185.98 $371.96
145 HEWQ5953A TONER,MAG,F/CLJ4700-10K 2 $185.98 $371.96
146 HEWQ6511A TONER F/LJ2400/2430-6K-USE HEWQ6511X 1 *NO BID *NO BID
147 HEWQ6511X TONER,F/LJ2400/2430-12K 2 $153.18 $306.36
148 HEWQ7551A TONER,F/P3005.#51A-6.5K 2 $86.77 $173.54
149 HEWQ7553A TONER,F/P2015-#53A(3K) 8 $59.23 $473.84

149a1 HEF9J64A INKCART 72869ML-MTT BLK/REG 2 $45.98 $91.96
149a2 HEF9J63A INKCART 72840ML-CYAN/REG 2 $28.49 $56.98
149a3 HEF9J61A INKCART 72840ML-YEL/REG 2 $28.49 $56.98
149a4 HEF9J62A INKCART 72840ML-MAG/REG 2 $28.49 $56.98
150 TOTAL LINE ITEM # 41 through # 149 $50,999.77

$262.90
151 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
152 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
153 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
154 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off(Hewlett Packard)toners not listed above 40.00%

LEXMARK

155

LEX52D0Z00 IMAGING UNIT,520Z /MS710 /800/MS810/ 
MX811/ 812-100K(LEX52D0ZA0) 22 $41.39 $910.58

156 LEX52D1H00 TONER,521H,F/MS810/MS811-25K 33 $366.87 $12,106.71
157 TOTAL LINE ITEM # 155  through # 156 $13,017.29
158 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
159 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
160 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
161 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off (Lexmark) toners not listed above 25.00%

OKI
162 OKI4807110 OKI,B432DN/MONOCHROME 6 *NO BID *NO BID
163 OKI43502301 OKI/B4400 2 $39.38 $78.76
164 OKI43503401 OKI MONO PRINTER/B4400 1 *NO BID *NO BID
165 TOTAL LINE ITEM # 162 through # 164 $78.76
166 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
167 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
168 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
169 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off (OKI) toners not listed above 24.00%

TOTAL LINE ITEM # 149a1 through # 149a4
per Addendum 1, dated 2-19-20
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RICOH
170 RIC406475 TONER,BLK,F/SPC231,310/242-6K 3 $97.95 $293.85
171 RIC406476 TONER,CYN,F/SPC231/310-6K 3 $126.98 $380.94
172 RIC406477 TONER,MAG,F/SPC231/310-6K 2 $126.98 $253.96
173 RIC406478 TONER,YEL,F/SPC231/310-6K 2 $126.98 $253.96
174 RIC408336 INKCART - PC301W 2 *NO BID *NO BID
175 RIC408337 INKCART - PC301W 1 *NO BID *NO BID
176 RIC408338 INKCART - PC301W 1 *NO BID *NO BID
177 RIC408339 INKCART - PC301W 1 *NO BID *NO BID
178 TOTAL LINE ITEM # 170 through # 177 $1,182.71
179 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
180 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
181 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
182 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off (Ricoh) toners not listed above 24.00%

XEROX
183 XER106R01278 PHASER 6130 2 $115.92 $231.84
184 XER106R01279 PHASER 6130 2 $115.92 $231.84
185 XER106R01280 PHASER 6130 2 $115.92 $231.84
186 XER106R01281 PHASER 6130 2 *NO BID *NO BID
187 XER106R01371 TONER,F/ PH.3600,BK-14K 4 $273.09 $1,092.36
188 XER106R01374 TONER,PH 3250-BK-5K 1 $139.16 $139.16
189 XER106R01388 CN/PHASER6280 1 $140.61 $140.61
190 XER106R01389 MAG/PHASER6280 1 $140.61 $140.61
191 XER106R01390 YL/PHASER6280 1 $140.61 $140.61
192 XER106R01391 BLK/PHASER6280 1 $131.98 $131.98
193 XER106R01392 TONER,CYN.F/6280-5.9K 1 $271.23 $271.23
194 XER106R01393 PHASER 6130 2 $271.23 $542.46
195 XER106R01394 TONER,YEL.F/6280-5.9K 1 $271.23 $271.23
196 XER106R01395 TONER,BLK,F/6280-7K 1 $238.36 $238.36
197 XER106R01594 TONER,CYAN.F/6500/6505-2.5K 3 $117.37 $352.11
198 XER106R01595 TONER,MAG..F/6500/6505-2.5K 2 $117.37 $234.74
199 XER106R01596 TONER,YEL.F/6500/6505-2.5K 2 $117.37 $234.74
200 XER106R01597 TONER,BLK.F/6500/6505-3K 3 $113.58 $340.74
201 XER106R02311 TONER,BLK.F/WC3315,3325-5K 4 $145.98 $583.92
202 XER113R00712 PHASER 4510 2 $277.81 $555.62
203 XER113R00723 CN/HP6180 2 $255.68 $511.36
204 XER113R00724 MAG/HP6180 2 $255.68 $511.36
205 XER113R00725 YL/HP6180 2 $255.68 $511.36
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206 XER113R00726 TONER,BLK F/6180-8K 3 $221.92 $665.76
207 TOTAL LINE ITEM # 183 through # 206 $8,305.84
208 Delivery Time ARO # of Days: 1 to 3
209 % Increase Year 1 Extension 3.00%
210 % Increase Year 2 Extension 3.00%
211 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT off (Xerox) toners not listed above 24.00%

MISCELLANEOUS
212 IFP75P4303 TONER,HY,F/IP1332/1352/1372-21K 10 $365.29 $3,652.90
213 IVRC364ASEL TONER,CMPT.F/4014 4 $55.29 $221.16

$79,515.36

* NO BID ITEMS can be purchased open market, ensuring a reasonable effort is made to obtain the best 
price.

GRAND TOTAL (All Items)
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