

RFB-DCP-51-20

Title: Processed or Natural Material Sand Winter Abrasives

AWARDED VENDOR LIST (See attached price list)

Term: 10/1/20 through 9/30/21, with two (2) one (1) year renewal options

JR Heffner
A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.
P.O. Box 302
91 Newman Road
Hudson, NY 12534
518-828-3218
jrh@acolarusso.com

Patrick Whiteley
Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.
27 Commerce Street
Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-266-3433
route82sand@verizon.net

Denise Tetz
E. Tetz & Sons Inc.
130 Crotty Road
Middletown, NY 10941
845-692-4486
denise@etetz-sons.com

Charles C. Morris
Tilcon New York Inc.
9 Entin Road
Parsippany, NJ 07054
973-366-7741
cmorris@tilconny.com

Kevin McCarthy
Peckham Materials Corp.
410 North Avenue
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
MAILING ADDRESS:
172 Prospect Hill Road
Brewster, NY 10509
914-949-2000
kmcca@peckham.com

Kevin McCarthy
Wingdale Materials, LLC
172 Prospect Hill Road
Brewster, NY 10509
914-949-2000
kmcca@peckham.com

Frank J. Doherty Jr.
Red Wing Properties Inc.
675 Leetown Road
MAILING ADDRESS:
P.O. Box 408
Stormville, NY 12582
845-221-2224
fjdjr7@redwingsandandgravel.com

County of Dutchess
Bid # RFB-DCP-51-20
Processed or Natural Material Sand Winter Abrasives
Term: 10/1/20 through 9/30/21, with two (2) one (1) year renewal options

AWARDED VENDORS:	A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.	E. Tetz & Sons Inc.	Peckham Materials	Red Wing Properties Inc.	Red Wing Properties Inc	Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.	Tilcon New York Inc.	Wingdale Materials, LLC	
LOCATION OF THE SOURCE:	91 Newman Road Hudson, NY 12534	Slate Hill, NY / Bloomingburg, NY	410 North Avenue Pleasant Valley, NY 12569	2332 Route 82 Billings, NY 12510	801 Spring Lake Road Milan, NY 12571	17 Canoe Hill Road Millbrook, NY 12545	461 Sheafe Road New Hamburg, NY 12590	3206 Pleasant Ridge Road Wingdale, NY 12594	
Schedule of Items	Unit	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	
Item D-1402 PICKUP PRICE	TON	\$13.25	\$19.00	\$15.50	\$16.00	\$8.50	\$15.50	\$11.98	\$21.00

Item D-1402 DELIVERED PRICE BY LOCATION

1. DPW Poughkeepsie	TON	\$23.00	\$32.00	\$20.50	no bid	\$17.50	no bid	\$18.23	no bid
2. DPW Amenia	TON	\$23.00	no bid	\$22.50	no bid	\$16.00	no bid	\$26.98	\$27.00
3. DPW Beekman	TON	\$26.00	\$32.00	\$22.50	no bid	\$18.50	no bid	\$19.48	\$26.00
4. DPW Pine Plains	TON	\$20.00	no bid	\$23.50	no bid	\$14.50	no bid	\$22.48	no bid
5. DPW Millbrook	TON	\$23.75	no bid	\$21.00	no bid	\$16.50	\$15.50	\$22.98	no bid
6. DPW Rhinebeck	TON	\$19.50	no bid	\$23.00	no bid	\$15.00	no bid	\$22.48	no bid
7. Town of Amenia	TON	\$23.00	no bid	\$23.00	no bid	\$15.00	no bid	\$26.98	\$27.00
8. Town of Beekman	TON	\$26.00	no bid	\$22.50	no bid	\$18.50	no bid	\$19.48	\$26.00
9. Town of Clinton	TON	\$20.75	no bid	\$21.00	no bid	\$16.00	no bid	\$22.48	no bid
10. Town of Dover	TON	\$25.25	no bid	\$24.00	no bid	\$18.50	no bid	\$22.48	\$26.00
11. Town of Fishkill	TON	\$26.75	\$29.00	no bid	no bid	\$19.00	no bid	\$18.23	no bid
12. Town of East Fishkill	TON	\$27.10	\$29.00	no bid	no bid	\$19.00	no bid	\$18.73	no bid
13. Town of Hyde Park	TON	\$21.10	no bid	\$21.00	no bid	\$17.00	no bid	\$19.23	no bid
14. Town of LaGrange	TON	\$25.50	\$32.00	\$21.00	no bid	\$18.00	no bid	\$19.23	no bid
15. Town of Milan	TON	\$20.00	no bid	\$23.50	no bid	\$14.25	no bid	\$24.98	no bid
16. Town of North East	TON	\$21.75	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$15.50	no bid	\$28.98	no bid
17. Town of Pawling	TON	\$27.75	\$36.00	no bid	no bid	\$19.50	no bid	\$22.48	\$26.00

AWARDED VENDORS:		A. Colarusso & Son, Inc.	E. Tetz & Sons Inc.	Peckham Materials	Red Wing Properties Inc.	Red Wing Properties Inc	Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.	Tilcon New York Inc.	Wingdale Materials, LLC
18. Town of Pine Plains	TON	\$20.00	no bid	\$23.50	no bid	\$14.50	no bid	\$22.48	no bid
19. Town of Pleasant Valley	TON	\$22.50	\$33.00	\$19.50	no bid	\$16.50	\$15.50	\$19.23	no bid
20. Town of Poughkeepsie	TON	\$23.75	\$32.00	\$21.50	no bid	\$17.50	\$19.50	\$18.23	no bid
21. Town of Red Hook	TON	\$19.25	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$14.00	no bid	\$24.98	no bid
22. Town of Rhinebeck	TON	\$20.25	no bid	\$23.00	no bid	\$15.00	no bid	\$22.48	no bid
23. Town of Stanford	TON	\$21.75	no bid	\$22.50	no bid	\$15.25	\$15.50	\$26.98	no bid
24. Town of Union Vale	TON	\$24.75	no bid	\$22.50	no bid	\$18.00	\$19.50	\$19.98	\$26.50
25. Town of Wappinger Falls	TON	\$25.50	\$29.00	no bid	no bid	\$18.50	no bid	\$17.23	no bid
26. Town of Washington	TON	\$23.75	no bid	\$21.00	no bid	\$16.50	\$15.50	\$22.98	no bid
27. Village of Fishkill	TON	\$26.75	\$29.00	no bid	no bid	\$19.00	no bid	\$18.23	no bid
28. Village of Millbrook	TON	\$24.25	no bid	\$21.00	no bid	\$16.50	\$15.50	\$22.98	no bid
29. Village of Millerton	TON	\$21.75	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$15.50	no bid	\$28.98	no bid
30. Village of Pawling	TON	\$27.25	\$36.00	no bid	no bid	\$19.50	no bid	\$22.48	\$26.00
31. Village of Tivoli	TON	\$18.75	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$14.00	no bid	\$27.98	\$26.00
32. Village of Wappingers Falls	TON	\$25.50	\$29.00	no bid	no bid	\$18.50	no bid	\$17.23	no bid
33. BOCES	TON	\$25.50	\$32.00	\$20.00	no bid	\$17.00	no bid	\$20.98	no bid
34. Dutchess Community College	TON	\$25.75	\$32.00	\$21.00	no bid	\$17.00	no bid	\$19.23	no bid
35. Hyde Park Central School District	TON	\$21.75	no bid	\$21.50	no bid	\$17.00	no bid	\$19.23	no bid
36. Wappinger Central School District	TON	\$27.25	\$29.00	no bid	no bid	\$18.00	no bid	\$17.73	no bid
37. City of Beacon	TON	\$27.25	\$29.00	no bid	no bid	\$19.50	no bid	\$18.23	no bid
38. City of Poughkeepsie	TON	\$23.75	\$32.00	\$21.50	no bid	\$17.50	no bid	\$18.23	no bid